TITLES8
BUILDINGS AND BUILDING REGULATIONS"?

Chapter 8.04 General Provisions
Sec. 8.04.010  Reserved
Sec. 8.04.020  Chief building official; appointment and removal
Sec. 8.04.030  Reserved
Sec. 8.04.040  Reserved
Sec. 8.04.050 Same; duties
Sec. 8.04.060 Same; right of entry
Sec. 8.04.070 Same; stop orders
Sec. 8.04.080 Same; electrical inspections

Chapter 8.08 Board of Appeals and Examiners
Sec. 8.08.010  Created
Sec. 8.08.020 Composition; term; qualifications
Sec. 8.08.030  Ex officio members not to have vote
Sec. 8.08.040 Terms; appointment
Sec. 8.08.050  Chairman generally
Sec. 8.08.060 Secretary generally
Sec. 8.08.070  Meetings and rules of procedure generally
Sec. 8.08.080 Powers and duties
Sec. 8.08.090  Parties who may appeal
Sec. 8.08.100  Time and procedure for perfecting appeal
Sec. 8.08.110 Fee
Sec. 8.08.120  Transmittal of record required
Sec. 8.08.130 Stay of proceedings
Sec. 8.08.140  Work done after docketing of appeal
Sec. 8.08.150  Hearings generally
Sec. 8.08.160  Decisions
Sec. 8.08.170  Judicial review

Chapter 8.12 Contractors
Sec. 8.12.010  Compliance with Chapter required
Sec. 8.12.020  Revocation and suspension
Sec. 8.12.030  Issuance of permits only to license holders or agents and owner-builders
Sec. 8.12.040  Compliance with law and supervisory clauses as required
Sec. 8.12.050  Approval of Building Official required for issuance of certain licenses
Sec. 8.12.060  Builders' licenses generally
Sec. 8.12.070  Application for licensees who employ qualified supervisors
Sec. 8.12.080 Examination fee
Sec. 8.12.090 Examinations
Sec. 8.12.100 Insurance
Sec. 8.12.110  Annual fees
Sec. 8.12.120  Compliance with division required for issuance of permit
Sec. 8.12.130 State license required
Sec. 8.12.140  Registration of electrical and plumbing contractors
Sec. 8.12.150 Appeals

Chapter 8.15 Carbon Monoxide Detectors
Sec. 8.15.010 Purpose and Scope
Sec. 8.15.020 Definitions
Sec. 8.15.030  Responsibilities
Sec. 8.15.040  Carbon Monoxide Detector — Installation Requirements



Sec. 8.15.050 Prohibitions

Sec. 8.15.060  Enforcement Responsibility

Sec. 8.15.070 Penalities and Remedies for Violations
Sec. 8.15.040 Effective Date

Chapter 8.16  International Residential Code
Sec. 8.16.010  Adoption of the 2003 Edition of the International Residential Code
Sec. 8.16.020  Amendments

! Cross reference—Double fee for failure to obtain required licenses, §1.04.110; fire prevention and protection, Title 11; mobile homes and mobile
home parks, Title 16, streets and sidewalks and other public property, Title 21; utilities, Tile 25, land use regulations, Title 26.

2 State law reference—Adoption of codes by reference, C.R.S., 31-16-201.

Chapter 8.20 International Building Code
Sec. 8.20.010  Adoption of the 2003 Edition of the International Building Code
Sec. 8.20.020  Amendments
Sec. 8.20.030  Violations and penalties
Sec. 8.20.040  Reserved

Chapter 8.24  National Electrical Code
Sec. 8.24.010  Adoption of the National Electrical Code, most current edition and the International
Code Council Electrical Code Administration Provisions, most current edition
Sec. 8.24.020 Amendments

Chapter 8.28 International Fuel Gas Code
Sec. 8.28.010  Adoption of the 2003 Edition of the International Fuel Gas Code
Sec. 8.28.020  Amendments

Chapter 8.32 International Existing Building Code
Sec. 8.32.010  Adoption of the International Existing Building Code, 2003 Edition
Sec. 8.32.020 Amendments

Chapter 8.36  International Plumbing Code
Sec. 8.36.010  Adoption of the International Plumbing Code, 2003 Edition
Sec. 8.36.020  Amendments
Sec. 8.36.030  Ultility assessment or utility connection permits; fees
Sec. 8.36.040  Tapping charges
Sec. 8.36.050  Compliance required
Sec. 8.36.060  Violations and penalties

Chapter 8.40 Water Conservation and Plumbing Advisory Code
Sec. 8.40.010  Applicability
Sec. 8.40.020  Installation of high-efficiency fixtures
Sec. 8.40.030  Landscaping criteria; grass species, irrigation
Sec. 8.40.040  Raw water supplies (nonpotable)
Sec. 8.40.050  Soil preparation

Chapter 8.44 International Mechanical Code
Sec. 8.44.010  Adoption of the 2003 Edition of the International Mechanical Code
Sec. 8.44.020 Amendments
Chapter 8.46 International Energy Conservation Code
Sec. 8.46.010 Adoption of the 2009 Edition of the International Energy Conservation Code
Sec. 8.46.020 Amendments

Chapter 8.48 Abatement of Dangerous Buildings Code
Sec. 8.48.010  Adoption of the 1997 Edition of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings
Sec. 8.48.020 Amendments



Chapter 8.50

Chapter 8.52

Chapter 8.54

Chapter 8.56

Flood Damage Prevention
Sec. 8.50.010  Findings of fact, purpose and methods of reducing flood loss
Sec. 8.50.020 Definitions
Sec. 8.50.030  General provisions
Sec. 8.50.040 Administration
Sec. 8.50.050 Provisions for flood hazard reduction

Building Conservation Code
Sec. 8.52.010  Adoption of the 1997 Edition of the Uniform Code for Building Conservation
Sec. 8.52.020  Amendments

Efficient Building Code
Deleted by Ordinance #11, 2009, §4

Construction Management Plan
Sec. 8.56.010  Adoption of Construction Management Plan
Sec. 8.56.020  Applicability



Chapter 8.04
GENERAL PROVISIONS
Sec. 8.04.010. Reserved.

Editor's note—Former Section 7-1, establishing fire zones within the City, was repealed by Ord. No. 33-1981, § 1. Said section was derived from
Code 1962, § 1-3-3; Ord. No. 18-1967; Ord. No. 27-1968; and Ord. No. 11-1969, §§ 1—3. (Code 1971, § 7-1)

Sec. 8.04.020. Chief building official; appointment and removal.

There shall be a Chief Building Official who shall be appointed by and be responsible to the City
Manager and shall serve at the pleasure of the City Manager. (Code 1962, § 3-5-1; Ord. No. 4-1969; Code
1971, § 7-2; Ord. No. 53-1994, § 2)

Sec. 8.04.030. Reserved.

Editor's note—Former Section 7-3, authority of the Chief Building Inspector to appoint a deputy and a fire marshal, was repealed by Ord. No. 53-1994,
§ 1. Said section was derived from Code 1962, § 3-5-1; Ord. No. 4-1969 and Ord. No. 27-1973, § 3. (Code 1971, § 7-3)

Sec. 8.04.040. Reserved.

Editor's note—Former Section 7-4, functions of the Chief Building Inspector, was repealed by Ord. No. 53-1994, § 1. Said Section was derived from
Code 1962, § 3-5-1 and Ord. No. 4-1969. (Code 1971, § 7-4)

Sec. 8.04.050. Same; duties.

The Chief Building Official shall be responsible for the enforcement of the Building Code, the Electrical
Code, Plumbing Code, Housing Code and all special hazard codes which may now or hereafter be adopted.
During or before the last week of January of each year the Chief Building Official shall submit to the City
Manager a full report of the work of the position. (Code 1962, § 3-5-1; Ord. No. 4-1969; Code 1971, § 7-5;
Ord. No. 53-1994, § 3)

Sec. 8.04.060. Same; right of entry.

Upon presentation of his or her credentials, the Chief Building Inspector or his or her duly authorized
representative may enter at any reasonable time any building, structure or premises in the City to perform any
duty imposed upon him or her by this Code. (Code 1962, § 3-5-1; Ord. No. 4-1969: Code 1971, § 7-6)

Sec. 8.04.070. Same; stop orders.

Whenever any construction or other work pursuant to development or repair of property is being done
contrary to the provisions of the Building Code, Electrical Code, Plumbing Code, Mechanical Code, Housing
Code, Fire Code and all other special hazard codes which may now or hereafter be adopted and the Zoning
Code of the City, the Chief Building Inspector shall order the work stopped by notice in writing served on any
person engaged in the doing or causing of such work to be done. It shall be unlawful for any person to fail or
refuse to obey such order and each day one (1) so notified or any other person who can reasonably be expected
to be informed of the notice, fails to comply with the order shall constitute a separate offense. (Code 1962,
§ 3-5-1; Ord. No. 4-1969; Code 1971, § 7-7; Ord. No. 18-1974, § 1)

Sec. 8.04.080. Same; electrical inspections.

Periodically, the Chief Building Inspector shall make a thorough examination of the electrical wiring
and appliances installed within the City. Whenever he or she shall find such installations or appliances to be in
an unsafe condition, he or she shall order the person owning, using, operating or installing the same in writing



to remedy the unsafe condition within fifteen (15) days or such longer time as may be deemed reasonable by
the inspector. It shall be unlawful for any person to fail or refuse to obey such order. The Chief Building
Inspector is hereby empowered to order the disconnection of electrical service to any defective installation or
appliance if the same shall constitute an immediate hazard to the public health, safety and welfare. (Code
1962, § 3-5-1; Ord. No. 4-1969; Code 1971, § 7-8)

Chapter 8.08
BOARD OF APPEALS AND EXAMINERS!

' Charter reference—Authority for Board of Appeals and Examiners, § 8.1.

Sec. 8.08.010. Created.

There is hereby created a Board of Appeals and Examiners for the City. (Code 1962, §§ 2-3-1, 5-3-3;
Code 1971, § 7-21)

Sec. 8.08.020. Composition; term; qualifications.

(a) The Board of Appeals and Examiners shall consist of seven (7) regular members and three (3) ex
officio members. The three (3) ex officio members shall be employees or officers of the City and the Fire
Department, provided, however, if there is a duly appointed and acting fire marshal for the City, he or she shall
be designated one (1) such ex officio member.

(b) All of the members of the Board of Appeals and Examiners shall have been qualified electors and
residents of the City for at least two (2) years.

(c) The Chief Building Official shall be an ex officio member of the Board of Appeals and Examiners
and shall act as secretary of the Board. (Code 1962, §§ 2-3-1, 5-3-3; Code 1971, § 7-22; Ord. No. 27-1973,
§ 4; Ord. No. 23-1974, § 1; Ord. No. 83-1979, § 1; Ord. No. 53-1994, § 4)

Sec. 8.08.030. Ex officio members not to have vote.

Ex officio members of the Board of Appeals and Examiners shall be without voting power in every
case. (Code 1962, §§ 2-3-1, 5-3-3; Code 1971, § 7-23)

Sec. 8.08.040. Terms; appointment.

The regular members of the Board of Appeals and Examiners shall serve for terms of four (4) calendar
years. The regular members of the Board of Appeals and Examiners shall be appointed by the City Council.
The membership of the Board of Appeals and Examiners will be appointed at alternate intervals. (Code 1962,
§§ 2-3-1, 5-3-3; Code 1971, § 7-24)

Sec. 8.08.050. Chairman generally.

The Board of Appeals and Examiners shall select from among the regular voting members a chairman
who shall act as presiding officer of the Board and who shall be responsible for the management and operation
of the Board. The chairman shall not serve as chairman for more than two (2) consecutive calendar years.
(Code 1962, § 5-3-4; Code 1971, § 7-25)



Sec. 8.08.060. Secretary generally.

The secretary of the Board of Appeals and Examiners shall keep and preserve a complete record of all
actions of the Board. (Code 1962, § 2-3-2; Code 1971, § 7-26)

Sec. 8.08.070. Meetings and rules of procedure generally.

A quorum for the transaction of business of the Board of Appeals and Examiners shall consist of four
(4) of the regular members. The Board of Appeals and Examiners shall adopt bylaws for the conduct of its
business not inconsistent with this Chapter and shall keep adequate minutes and records and make such rules
of procedure as it deems necessary. (Code 1962, § 5-3-4; Code 1971, § 7-27)

Sec. 8.08.080. Powers and duties.

The Board of Appeals and Examiners shall have the following powers and duties:

(a) To adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its investigations and examinations
and to render all decisions in writing to the Building Inspector in duplicate.

(b) To recommend to the City Council such new legislation as it may deem in harmony with its
functions and the matters given to it for administration and also to recommend such new legislation
affecting the building trade or industry as it shall deem advisable for the protection of the public health,
safety and welfare.

(¢) To hear and determine all appeals from orders of the Chief Building Official denying,
suspending or revoking contractor's licenses, in conformity with this Code.

(d) And to perform such other duties as the City Council may by this Code or any code adopted
herein or any amendment thereto, from time to time impose upon it. (Code 1962, § 2-3-3; Code 1971,
§ 7-28; Ord. No. 53-1994, § 5)

Sec. 8.08.090. Parties who may appeal.

Any person aggrieved by any decision or order of the Building Inspector may appeal such decision or
order to the Board of Appeals and Examiners. (Code 1962, § 5-3-5; Code 1971, § 7-36)

Sec. 8.08.100. Time and procedure for perfecting appeal.

Every appeal to the Board of Appeals and Examiners must be perfected within thirty (30) days from the
date of the decision or order appealed from. An appeal is perfected by filing notice of appeal with the
secretary of the Board of Appeals and Examiners in the office of the Building Inspector upon a form provided
by the Board of Appeals and Examiners. Such notice shall contain appropriate reference to the decision or
order appealed from, as well as the grounds of the appeal. A duplicate copy of such notice of appeal shall be
filed with the chairman of the Board of Appeals and Examiners.

The Board of Appeals and Examiners may extend the time within which an appeal may be taken where
grounds for enlargement of time are shown. In cases where the decision or order appealed from pertains to a
structure or building which can be demonstrated by the Building Inspector to be unsafe or dangerous, the
Building Inspector may apply to the Board of Appeals and Examiners to limit the time for such appeal in order
to avoid any hazard to life or property. (Code 1962, § 5-3-5; Code 1971, § 7-37)



Sec. 8.08.110. Fee.

At the time of perfecting an appeal to the Board of Appeals, the appellant shall be required to pay an
appeal fee of seventy-five dollars ($75.00), which fee may be returned to the appellant at the discretion of the
Board of Appeals and Examiners if the appellant is substantially sustained. (Code 1962, § 5-3-5; Code 1971,
§ 7-38; Ord. No. 53-1994, § 6)

Sec. 8.08.120. Transmittal of record required.

Whenever an appeal is taken to the Board of Appeals and Examiners, the Building Inspector shall
transmit to the Board all relevant records and data upon which the appeal was taken. (Code 1962, § 5-3-5;
Code 1971, § 7-39)

Sec. 8.08.130. Stay of proceedings.

An appeal to the Board of Appeals and Examiners shall stay all proceedings in connection with the
decision or order appealed from unless and until the Building Inspector shall have certified to the Board after
notice of appeal has been perfected that a stay would cause hazard to life and property. In such case
proceedings pursuant to the decision or order of the Building Inspector shall not be stayed except by order of
the Board of Appeals and Examiners or by a restraining order issued by a court of record of competent
jurisdiction. No such restraining order, whether temporary or otherwise, shall be granted without notice, as
prescribed in the Rules of Civil Procedure, to the Building Inspector and without due cause shown. (Code
1962, § 5-3-5; Code 1971, § 7-40)

Sec. 8.08.140. Work done after docketing of appeal.

Any work done contrary to the order of the Building Inspector after docketing of an appeal hereunder,
pending determination of such appeal, shall be subject to abatement should the order be affirmed and may not
be considered by the Board of Appeals and Examiners as a mitigating or extenuating circumstance. (Code
1962, § 5-3-5; Code 1971, § 7-41)

Sec. 8.08.150. Hearings generally.

The Board of Appeals and Examiners shall fix a reasonable time for the hearing of an appeal, giving
notice in writing to the parties in interest and shall reach its decision within a reasonable time thereafter.
Parties may appear before the Board of Appeals and Examiners in person, by agent or by attorney. The Board
of Appeals and Examiners may require additional data and tests necessary for adequate consideration of the
appeal. (Code 1962, § 5-3-5; Code 1971, § 7-42)

Sec. 8.08.160. Decisions.

The Board of Appeals and Examiners shall have the power in all cases appealed to it from decisions or
orders of the Building Inspector to reverse or affirm or modify in whole or in part, the decision or order
appealed from. No decision of the Board of Appeals and Examiners shall vary or be inconsistent with the
terms, provisions and requirements of this Chapter. (Code 1962, § 5-3-5; Code 1971, § 7-43)

Sec. 8.08.170. Judicial review.

Within thirty (30) days after the entry of any decision or order of the Board of Appeals and Examiners,
any person who is aggrieved by such decision or order may seek to review the same in a court of record of
competent jurisdiction. Review shall not be extended further than to determine whether the Board of Appeals



and Examiners has exceeded its jurisdiction or abused its discretion. (Ord. No. 23-1970, § 1; Code 1971, § 7-
44)



Chapter 8.12
CONTRACTORS

Editor's note—Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1, repealed former Ch. 8.12, pertaining to Contractors and enacted a new Ch. 8.12 as herein set out. Former Ch.
8.12 was derived from Code 1962 §§ 5-3-1, 5-3-2, 5-3-8—5-3-14, 5-3-16, 5-3-17, Code 1971 §§ 7-60—7-68, 7-77—7-108 and Ord. Nos. 23-1970,
37-1977, 44-1978, 3-1990, 53-1994, 53-1995, 43-1996 and 54-1999.

Sec. 8.12.010. Compliance with Chapter required.

It shall be unlawful for any person to violate any provisions of this Chapter or to violate or refuse to
obey any order issued by the Chief Building Official or neglect to pay any fee assessed by the Chief Building
Official. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.12.020. Revocation and suspension.

(a) The Chief Building Official shall have the authority to issue an order to show cause why the license
issued hereunder to any licensee should not be suspended or revoked. Any such order shall grant the licensee
ten (10) days in which to show cause and shall inform the licensee of the basis for issuance of the order.

(b) The following acts or omissions of any person or firm holding a license under this Chapter or any
applicant for a license under this Chapter shall constitute grounds for which the Chief Building Official may
suspend, revoke or refuse renewal of any license or deny an application for said license:

(1) Causing or allowing to exist conditions hazardous to the health, safety and welfare of
workmen and the public;

(2) Disregard and willful violation of this Code, including but not limited to the Land Use Code,
the Uniform Building Code and related Uniform Codes as adopted and the Colorado Revised Statutes;
relating to buildings or construction or contractor licensing;

(3) Failure to comply with any lawful order of the Building Official or his or her designated
representative;

(4) Misrepresentation or falsification of a material fact in an application to obtain a license or
permit under this and other applicable codes;

(5) Conviction of a misdemeanor or felony relating to the contractor's performance of construction
work or the contractor's conduct of his or her construction business;

(6) Failure to obtain a building or other applicable permit for any work as required by Code,
including but not limited to the Land Use Code and the Uniform Building Code and Uniform Codes as
adopted;

(7) Failure to ensure that the person with whom a subcontractor contracts has obtained valid
building or other applicable permit for any work required by this Code;

(8) Contracting for or performing construction work that requires a particular license without
holding a valid license for that work;

(9) Use of a contractor's license to obtain building permits for another person's project for which
the contractor will not be responsible;



(10) Disregard or deviation from the plans and specifications approved by the Building Official
for which the permit was issued without the approval of the building official;

(11) Failure to ensure that any subcontractor hired by the contractor is licensed in compliance with
the regulations set forth in this Section;

(12) Failure to appear after proper notice, as set forth in this Section, at a building official hearing;

(13) Failure to obtain and maintain a current County Use Tax license through the county finance
office. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.12.030. Issuance of permits only to license holders or agents and owner-builders.

(a) On any work requiring a building permit(s), the permit(s) shall be issued only to licensed
contractors, authorized representatives of licensed contractors and owner-builders.

(b) For purposes of this Chapter, an "owner-builder" is an individual personally engaged in the
construction (new or remodel) of a single-family residence or accessory, building for his or her own use. The
following requirements shall apply to owner-builders seeking permits for construction:

(1) The owner-builder shall not be issued more than one (1) building permit for new home
construction in any two year period and not more than one building permit at a time;

(2) The owner-builder has read applicable regulations and provisions of this Chapter and
applicable state law and affirmed in writing that the proposed project will comply with all such
requirements;

(3) It is the responsibility of the owner-builder to see that all paid personnel shall be covered by
workman's compensation insurance as required by state law;

(4) The owner-builder must be present at the work site during all inspections and conferences with
the building division, unless prior arrangements have been made with the building officials.

In the event that any of the above listed requirements are not met at any time during the course of a
permitted project, the Chief Building Official may suspend or revoke the owner-builder's permit. In the case
of a suspended building permit the owner- builder shall have a reasonable time to correct the problem. If not
corrected within the time period, the permit may be revoked. In the case of either a suspended or revoked
building permit, the owner-builder may ask for a review at the next scheduled Building Code Board of
Appeals meeting. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.12.040. Compliance with law and supervisory clauses as required.

All licenses enumerated in this division shall be issued by the chief building official in accordance with
the provisions of this Code and shall be subject to the supervisory clauses contained in this division. The
Chief Building Official is authorized to administer tests for the licenses and owner-builders as required by this
division, as per the standards and regulations promulgated by the Board of Examiners for Standardized
Testing. The Chief Building Official is further authorized to recognize, for purposes of contractor licensing
and owner builder permits, results of tests administered by other jurisdictions. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.12.050. Approval of Building Official required for issuance of certain licenses.

(a) No person may be issued a license to engage in the following listed trades, jobs or contractual
service as hereinafter enumerated unless approved by the Chief Building Official.



(1) General Contractor (Unlimited);

(2) General Contractor (Commercial);

(3) General Contractor (Light Commercial);
(4) General Contractor (Home Builder);

(5) Specialty;

(b) All persons having valid licenses with the Community Development Department to engage in the
aforementioned trades, jobs or contractual services, shall not be required to be examined by the Chief Building
Official. All persons must hold a license from the State, if required by the State, before engaging in any trade,
job or contractual services within the County. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.12.060. Builders' licenses generally.

(a) General Contractor (Unlimited). This classification qualifies the holder to contract for the
construction, alteration or repair of any structure of any type of construction and occupancy group as permitted
by the International Building Code.

(b) General Contractor (Commercial). This classification qualifies the holder to contract for the
construction of any structure of any type of construction and occupancy group as permitted by the
International Building Code, with the exception of Type I and Type II buildings. Also this classification
qualifies the holder for the alteration or repair of any structure of any type of construction and occupancy
group permitted by the International Building Code.

(¢) General Contractor (Light Commercial). This classification qualifies the holder to contract for the
construction, alteration or repair of Groups A-2, A-3, B, E, M, R, S-1, S-2 and U Occupancies with the
exception of Type I and Type II buildings as permitted by the International Building Code.

(d) General Contractor (Home Builder). This classification qualifies the holder for the construction,
alteration or repair of buildings regulated by the International Residential Code.

(e) Specialty. This classification qualifies the holder to contract for work involving specialty trades
regulated by the International Codes, including the following:

(1) Alteration and maintenance;

(2) Drywall;

(3) Fire alarm system installation;
(4) Fire sprinkler system installation;
(5) Historic specialty contractor;

(6) Insulation;

(7) Mechanical contractor;

(8) Roofing;

(9) Solid fuel and gas appliance;



(10) Temporary contractor.

(f) For the purposes of this Section, a contractor or subcontractor hired specifically for one (1) job may
be issued a temporary contractor's license. It shall only be valid for six (6) months. The applicant for a
temporary contractor's license shall only be required to complete an application, no testing shall be required.
Only one (1) temporary contractor's license can be applied for within one (1) year. (Ord. No. 5-19995, § 1
[part]; Ord. No. 59-2003, § 3)

Sec. 8.12.070. Application for licensees who employ qualified supervisors.

Each individual who acts as a supervisor on any work for which a permit is required must be tested in
accordance with the provisions of this Chapter for the work proposed to be done. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1

[part])
Sec. 8.12.080. Examination fee.

Applicants for contractor's licenses shall be required to pay a fee as established by Section 2.12.100 of
this Code. (Ord. No. 55, § 1 [part]; Ord. No. 59-2003, § 3)

Sec. 8.12.090. Examinations.

(a) The Chief Building Official, before issuing any license required by this Chapter, shall require the
applicant to take such examinations, written or oral, as the Chief Building Official may determine to be
appropriate. In lieu of such examination, the Chief Building Official may recognize and accept the results of
examinations administered by other governmental jurisdictions with which the County is a party to an
intergovernmental agreement regarding recognition of such test results.

(b) Examinations shall be given at reasonable intervals. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part])
Sec. 8.12.100. Insurance.

Every contractor granted a license under the terms of this Chapter shall be required to maintain at all
times employee liability and public liability insurance with minimum limits of not less than one-hundred-
thousand dollars ($100,000.00) for one (1) person and three-hundred-thousand dollars ($300,000.00) for any
one (1) accident and property damage insurance with a minimum limit of not less than one-hundred-thousand
dollars ($100,000.00) for any one (1) accident. (Ord. No. 5-19995, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.12.110. Annual fees.

Holders of contractors' licenses shall be required to pay a fee as established by this Code, Section
2.12.100. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part]; Ord. No. 47-2002, § 11; Ord. No. 59-2003, § 3)

Sec. 8.12.120. Compliance with division required for issuance of permit.

(a) No permit shall be issued to any contractor who has not first obtained a license as required in this
Chapter or who is delinquent in the payment of annual license fees or use taxes or whose license has been
suspended or revoked by action of the Chief Building Official.

(b) A licensed contractor may apply for and be issued permits to only such work as he or she is entitled
to do under their respective licenses.



(¢) Any application for a permit or license filed in derogation of this Section shall be deemed to have
been filed with fraudulent intent and shall be a nullity. Any permit or license issued on the basis of such
fraudulent application shall be null and void. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.12.130. State license required.

All persons performing plumbing or electrical work of any type regulated or licensed by the State must
hold valid State licenses before engaging in any trade, job or contractual service within the unincorporated
county. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.12.140. Registration of electrical and plumbing contractors.

As a condition of performing services within the county, electrical and plumbing contractors shall
register with the Chief Building Official. Applicants for registration must demonstrate that they hold a valid
contractor's license issued by the State. Registrations made under this Section shall terminate on the last day
of the year. (Ord. No. 5-19995, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.12.150. Appeals.

Appeals of any final decision of the Building Official may be made pursuant to the bylaws of the
Building Code Board of Appeals. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 1 [part])



Chapter 8.15
Carbon Monoxide Detectors

Section 8.15.010 Purpose and Scope.

This chapter is enacted for the purpose of protecting the health and safety of the residents of the City, its
visitors and employees, by requiring operable carbon monoxide detectors in existing and new residential
occupancies thereby hopefully reducing the number of injuries and fatalities resulting from carbon monoxide
(CO) poisoning.

The provisions of this ordinance shall apply to all new residential construction containing a sleeping
unit, additions to residential buildings containing a sleeping unit, remodels of residential buildings containing a
sleeping unit for which a building permit is required and to the replacement or addition of a fuel burning
appliance for which a permit is required.

Section 8.15.020 Definitions.
The following terms as used in this chapter shall have the indicated meaning:

Building Codes: The building, fire and other technical codes adopted pursuant to Chapter 8 of this Code.

CO Detector: A device sensing invisible particles of carbon monoxide that is either battery powered or AC
powered with battery back up that has been installed in accordance with its manufacturer’s recommendations,
which, when activated, will provide some form of visual or audible detector, and which has been either UL

(Underwriters Laboratories Inc.) listed or CSA (Canadian Standards Association) approved.

Dwelling: Any building or portion thereof containing one or more dwelling units occupied as, or deigned or
intended for occupancy as, a residence by one or more families.

Dwelling Unit: Any building or portion thereof designed, occupied, or intended as a residence, with complete
and independent living facilities for one or more persons including permanent provisions for living, sleeping,
eating, cooking and sanitation.

Residential Occupancies:

A. Any of the residential uses as such terms are defined and described in International Residential
Code and International Building Code in Chapter 8.16 and 8.20 of this Code.

B. Any residential occupancy or any institutional occupancy with sleeping units as such terms are
defined in the building codes.

C. Any other occupancy used for sleeping purposes.

Separate Sleeping Area: Bedrooms or sleeping rooms separated by other use areas, such as a kitchen or living
room, but not including bathrooms.

Sleeping Unit: A room or space in which people sleep, which can also include permanent provisions for
living, eating, and either sanitation or kitchen facilities but not both.

Section 8.15.030 Responsibilities.



A. All existing residential occupancies and all residential occupancies to be constructed after the
effective date of this ordinance shall be equipped with CO detectors in accordance with the requirements of
this Chapter,

B. The owner of a residential occupancy shall be responsible to install and maintain required CO
detector(s) in such residential occupancy in accordance with the requirements of this Chapter. The owner of a
residential occupancy shall test and replace all batteries necessary for operation of a required CO detector,
except for dwellings or dwelling units where the tenant has been notified of such responsibility. The owner of
a residential occupancy shall immediately repair or replace any defective CO detector required under the
provision of this Chapter.

C. The owner of a dwelling or dwelling unit that is rented or leased to a tenant, shall immediately,
upon notice from the tenant, repair or replace a defective CO detector required to be located within such
dwelling or dwelling unit, except that the owner need not repair or replace any CO detector where the
defective condition was caused by the tenant, the tenant’s family, or the tenant’s guests or invitees. The owner
shall install new batteries in any required CO detector at the beginning of a new lease or tenancy. The owner
shall furnish to the tenant at the beginning of a new lease or new tenancy written notice of the owner’s
responsibility to install and maintain a required CO detector on the premises. The tenant shall inform the
owner of any CO detector malfunction, test and replace batteries necessary for operation and repair or replace
a defective CO detector in the event that the defective condition was caused by the tenant, the tenant’s family,
or the tenant’s guests or invitees, by inappropriate use or misuse of the dwelling or dwelling unit during the
rental term or any extension of it.

D. A tenant in possession of a dwelling or dwelling unit shall be responsible for testing and replacing
any batteries necessary for operation of a required CO detector, informing the owner of a CO detector
malfunction and repairing or replacing a defective CO detector in the event that the defective condition was
caused by the tenant, the tenant’s family, or the tenant’s guests or invitees, by inappropriate use or misuse of
the dwelling or dwelling unit during the rental term or any extension of it.

8.15.040 Carbon Monoxide Detector —Installation Requirements.

A. Carbon Monoxide detector(s) shall be centrally located outside of each separate sleeping area in
the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms or sleeping rooms. Residential occupancies shall be considered to be
in compliance with this requirement if CO detector(s) are installed within a dwelling unit such that an audible
signal not less than 70 decibels reaches each sleeping area. CO detectors shall be hard wired in new
construction. In interior alterations, repairs or additions requiring a permit, or when one or more sleeping
rooms are added or created in existing dwellings, detectors shall be hard wired where the alterations or repairs
result in the removal of interior wall or ceiling finishes unless there is an attic , crawlspace or basement
available which would provide access for hard wiring.

B. Carbon monoxide detectors shall be installed within each sleeping area containing any fuel burning
appliance such as a gas log, decorative gas fireplace appliances, gas clothes dryer or wood burning appliance,
etc.

C. It is the intention of this Chapter to implement the requirements of the existing building codes,
including NFPA #720, 2009 edition approved as an American October 10, 2008, to the greatest extent
practicable for existing residential occupancies. The building official or the fire official may approve
alternative locations or methods for the installation of CO detectors, if the result would meet the spirit and
intent of the building codes and NFPA #720. The building official, in coordination with the fire official, may
also adopt written guidelines illustrating or describing required locations of CO detectors, and any approved



alternative locations or methods for bringing residential occupancies into compliance with the requirements of
this chapter.

D. A CO detector is deemed approved for purposes of this Chapter if it complies with all applicable
state and federal regulations, and bears the label of a nationally recognized standard testing laboratory and
meets the revised standard of at least UL 2034 and subsequent revision or its equivalent. The CO detector may
be a combination smoke/gas/CO device.

E. Each CO detector shall be mounted in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions, though a
ceiling mount is preferred. CO detector(s) may not be mounted in areas of low air movement (dead air
spaces),

F. If a CO detector is required to be installed in a common hallway and found to be tampered with it
shall be replaced with a hard-wired device (missing or inoperable batteries shall not constitute tampering). Any
CO detector found to be missing a battery shall be replaced by the owner with a tamper proof CO detector with
a sealed battery.

G. In new construction, the required CO detector shall receive their primary power from the building
wiring when such wiring is served from a commercial source, and when primary power is interrupted, shall
receive power from a battery. Wiring shall be permanent and without a disconnecting switch other than those
required for overcurrent protection. CO detectors shall be permitted to be battery operated when installed in
buildings without commercial power or in buildings that undergo alterations, repairs or additions as stipulated
in Section 8.15.040 A.

Section 8.15.050 Prohibitions.

A. It shall be unlawful for any owner of a residential occupancy to fail to install and maintain an
operable CO detector when required under the provisions of this chapter.

B. It shall be unlawful for any person to remove or render ineffective a CO detector installed to satisfy
the requirements of this ordinance. This provision shall not apply to a building owner, manager or his/her
agent in the normal procedure of repairing or replacing a CO detector.

C. No person shall, without privilege to do so, knowingly move, deface, damage, destroy or otherwise
improperly tamper with a CO detector required to be installed pursuant to the provisions of this Chapter so as
to destroy or diminish its effectiveness or availability for its intended purpose.

Section 8.15.060 Enforcement Responsibility.

The building official and the fire code official, or their designees, shall monitor compliance with this
Chapter and may perform enforcement inspections upon, but not limited to, the following instances: when
notified of a change in occupancy; when reviewing or inspecting the construction, repair, rehabilitation or
renovation of the interior of a residential occupancy pursuant to a required permit, when inspecting at the
request of the building owner; when inspecting for any other purpose under the provisions of this code; or
when on the premises for any lawful purpose, including but not limited to such purposes as responding to a fire
or other request for fire department services.

Section 8.15.070 Penalties and Remedies for Violations.



A. Infraction: A violation of the provisions of this Chapter is an infraction and upon conviction shall
be punishable as set forth in Chapter 1.04 of this Code.

B. Other Remedies: This Chapter may also be enforced by injunction, mandamus, judicial abatement
or any other appropriate action in law or equity.

C. Daily Violations: Each day that any violation of this Chapter continues shall be considered a
separate offense for purposes of the penalties and remedies available to the city.

8.15.080  Effective Date: All owners of existing residential occupancies shall come into compliance with
the requirements of this Chapter on or before March 2, 2009.



Chapter 8.16
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

Sec. 8.16.010. Adoption of the 2003 Edition of the International Residential Code.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the laws of the State and the Charter of the City, there
is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the
International Residential Code, 2003 Edition, including Appendix E, F, H, J and K as published by the
International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, except as
otherwise provided by amendment or deletion as contained in Section 8.16.020 of this Chapter. At least one
(1) copy of the International Residential Code shall be available for inspection during regular business hours.
(Ord. No. 55-1999, § 2 [part]; Ord. No. 59-2003, § 2)

Sec. 8.16.020. Amendments.

The International Residential Code, 2003 Edition, as adopted by the City at Section 8.16.010, is hereby
amended to read as follows:

(a) Section R101.1, Insert: "City of Aspen" for NAME OF JURISDICTION].
(b) Section R102.7. "Existing Structures" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code shall be
permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this code, the
International Existing Building Code or as is deemed necessary by the building official for the
general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public."

(¢) Section R103 DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING SAFETY is hereby amended to read as
follows:

"SECTION 103 DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

"Section 103.1 The Division of Building Safety is hereby created and the official in charge
thereof shall be known as the Building Official."

(d) Section R104.6 "Right of Entry" is hereby amended to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "If entry is refused or
no person having charge or control over the building or premises can be located, the Building
Official shall obtain a warrant from the Municipal Court authorizing the Building Official to make
entry onto the building or premises."

(e) Section R104.8 "Liability" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The Building Official or his or her authorized representative charged with the enforcement of
this Code, acting in good faith and without malice in the discharge of his or her duties, shall not
thereby render himself or herself personally liable for any damage that may accrue to persons or
property as a result of any act or omission in the discharge of his or her duties.

"This code shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating or controlling any building or structure for any damage to persons or property caused by
defects on or in such premises, nor shall the Code Enforcement Agency, any employee thereof or
City be held as assuming any such responsibility or liability by reason of the adoption of this code



or by the exercise of inspections authorized and carried out hereunder or by the issuance of any
permits or certificates issued pursuant to this code."

(f) Section R105.3.2 "Time limitation of application" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"An application for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned six (6)
months after the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit
has been issued. The Building Official is authorized to grant an extension not exceeding six (6)
months. The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated."

(g) Section R105.5 "Expiration” is hereby amended to read as follows:

"Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such
permit is commenced within twelve (12) months after its issuance, or if the work authorized on the
site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of one hundred eighty (180) days after
the time the work is commenced. The Building Official is not authorized to grant an extension."

(h) Section R106.3.3 "Phased approval" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The Building Official is authorized to issue a permit for the construction of the foundation of
a building only after the documents for the whole building or structure have been submitted and
approved by the appropriate referral agencies. The holder of a foundation permit shall proceed at
the holder's own risk without assurance that a permit for the entire structure will be granted."

(1) Section R108.1 "Payment of fees" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by Section 2.12.100 of this Code are paid
in full."

(3) Section R109.3.1 "Other inspections" is hereby amended and to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "Other inspections
shall include but not be limited to line-grade verification and snow melt insulation and controls."

(k) Section R109.3.10 "Final inspection" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The final inspection shall be made after all work required by the building permit is completed
and all applicable referral agencies have accepted the work to comply with conditions of approval
and any specific regulations."

(I) "Section R109.5 Reinspections" is hereby added to read as follows:

"A reinspection fee may be assessed when an inspection is called for and the work is not
complete, required corrections are not made, field copy of approved plans is not readily available to
the inspector, work is not accessible or for deviating from approved plans."

(m) Section 110.4 "Temporary Occupancy" is hereby deleted and replaced to read as follows:

"Section R110.4 Conditional occupancy. The Building Official is authorized to issue a
conditional certificate of occupancy before the completion of the entire work covered by the permit
or conditions of approval, provided that portions of the building shall be occupied safely. The
conditional certificate of occupancy shall clearly state the portions of the building that may be
occupied, the conditions that must be met and a time period during which the conditional certificate
of occupancy is valid."



(n) Section R112.1 Board of Appeals, General is hereby amended to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "The Building Code
Board of Appeals shall possess that authority as provided in this Code, Chapter 8.08."

(o) R202 "Definitions. Habitable Space" is hereby amended as follows. The definition shall
remain as written, with this sentence appended to the end: "Unfinished basements are considered
habitable space."

(p) Table R302.2(1) shall read as follows:

"Ground snow load

Wind Speed 90/B

Seismic design category C

Weathering Severe

Frost line depth 36"

Termite None to slight
Decay None to slight
Winter design temp -16

Ice shield underlayment required Yes

Flood hazards

Air Freezing index 2000

Mean annual temperature 40"

(@) Section R303.6 Stairway illumination is hereby amended to define "exterior stairs," as applies
to this Section, as "those stairs outside the perimeter walls of the building which serve any exits from
the building or serve as access to the public right-of-way. Exterior stairs used for landscape purposes
are not subject to the requirements of this Section except as required above."

(r) Section R317.2.2 is amended by changing the reference to minimum roof covering required in
the exception from Class C to Class A.

(s) Add Section R324 Automatic fire sprinkler systems to read as follows:

"Automatic fire sprinkler systems are required in all structures five thousand (5,000) square
feet or greater as defined by fire area (IBC Section 702.1) and in structures two (2) stories or more
in height and containing four (4) or more dwelling units. Fire separations shall not constitute
separate buildings for this purpose."

(t) Delete Section R408.2 #6 and replace with:
"Noncombustible corrosion-resistant mesh with openings not to exceed ' inch."
(u) Section R806.1 is amended by changing the second sentence to read as follows:

"Attic ventilation openings, soffit vents and vents through roofs shall not exceed 144 square
inches each. Such vents shall be covered with noncombustible corrosion-resistant mesh with
openings not to exceed Y4 inch."



(v) Section R902.1 is amended by changing the second sentence to read as follows:

"The minimum roof coverings installed shall be Class B and Class A in the HIGH areas
identified by the City of Aspen Wildfire Hazard Assessment Map."

(w) Add Section R903.5.1 Snow shed design to read as follows.

"Roofs shall be designed so that they do not shed ice and snow onto potentially occupied areas
such as a walkway, stairway, alley, deck, pedestrian and vehicular exit from buildings or areas
where there is potential for personal injury or property damage and areas directly above or in front
of gas utility or electric utility meters.

"Exception: Mechanical barriers installed to roof framing members or solid blocking secured
to framing in accordance to manufacturers instructions."

(x) Section R905.2.7.1 Ice protection is hereby amended to read as follows:

"An ice dam barrier that consists of at least two (2) layers of underlayment cemented together
or of a self-adhering polymer modified bitumen sheet shall be used in lieu of normal underlayment
and shall extend from the roof eave edge at least six feet inside the exterior wall line as measured
along the roof surface, twenty-four (24) inches from the centerline of the valley and up twenty-four
(24) inches on the vertical wall at a roof and wall juncture."

(y) Add Section R1003.1.1 Fireplaces allowed, to read as follows.
"The number of fireplaces allowed shall be determined by this Code, Section 13.08.070."
(z) Delete Chapter 11 in its entirety and replace to read as follows:

"Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency. The provisions of the 2009 International Energy
Conservation Code as adopted and amended as Section 8.46 shall apply to all matters governing
the design and construction of buildings for energy efficiency."

(aa) Section G2425.8 item #7 is hereby amended to read as follows:
"Unvented room heaters are not allowed."

(bb) Section G2445 Unvented room heaters is hereby amended to read as follows in its entirety:
"G2445.1 General. Unvented room heaters are not allowed."

(cc) Section P3103.1 Roof extension shall read as follows:

"All open vent pipes which extend through a roof shall be terminated at least twelve (12)
inches above the roof or six (6) inches above the anticipated snow accumulation, except where a
roof is to be used for any purpose other than weather protection, the vent extensions shall be run at
least seven (7) feet above the roof."

(Ord. No. 59-2003, §2; Ord. No. 7, 2007, §2; Ord. No. 11-2009,§2))



Chapter 8.20
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

Editor's note—Ord. No. 55-1999, §2, repealed former Ch. 8.20, pertaining to the Building Code and enacted a new Ch. 8.20 as herein set out. Former
Ch. 8.20 was derived from Code 1962 §§4-1-1—4-1-4, Code 1971 §§7-140—7-143 and Ord. Nos. 22-1960, 4-1965, 32-1967, 36-1968, 22-1969, 7-
1971, 9-1974, 15-1974, 70-1975, 13-1976, 21-1976, 27-1976, 45-1976, 63-1976, 12-1977, 12-1978, 1-1979, 52-1979, 17-1981, 33-1981, 1-1983, 9-
1983, 20-1984, 62-1985, 7-1987, 32-1987, 10-1988, 59-1990, 79-1990, 44-1991, 53-1994, 68-1994, 53-1995, 54-1995, 3-1996, 12-1996, 43-1996 and
15-1997.

Sec. 8.20.010. Adoption of the 2003 Edition of the International Building Code.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the laws of the State and the Charter of the City, there
is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the
International Building Code, 2003 Edition, including Appendix C, E, I and J published by the International
Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, except as otherwise
provided by amendment or deletion as contained in Section 8.20.020 of this Chapter. At least one (1) copy of
the International Building Code shall be available for inspection during regular business hours. (Ord. No. 55-
1999, §2 [part]; Ord. No. 59-2003, §1)

Sec. 8.20.020. Amendments.

The International Building Code, 2003 Edition, as adopted by the City at Section 8.20.010, is hereby
amended to read as follows;

(a) Section 101.1 Insert: "City of Aspen" for NAME OF JURISDICTION].
(b) Section 101.4 "Referenced Codes" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The other codes listed in Sections 101.4.1 through 101.4.5 and referenced elsewhere in this
Code shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each
reference."

(c) Section 101.4.1 "Electrical" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The provisions of the most current version of the National Electric Code shall apply to the
installation of electrical systems, including alterations, repairs, replacement, equipment, appliances,
fixtures, fittings and appurtenances thereto."

(d) Section 101.4.5 "Property maintenance" is hereby deleted in its entirety.
(e) Section 104.6 "Fire prevention" is hereby deleted in its entirety.
(f) Section 101.4.7 "Energy" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"Section 101.4.7 Energy. The provisions of the 2009 International Energy Conservation Code
as adopted and amended in Section 8.46 shall apply to all matters governing the design and
construction of buildings for energy efficiency."

(g) Section 102.5 "Existing structures" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this Code shall be
permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this Code, the
International Existing Building Code or as is deemed necessary by the building official for the
general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public."



(h) SECTION 103 DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING SAFETY is hereby amended to read as
follows:

"SECTION 103 DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

"Section 103.1 The Division of Building Safety is hereby created and the official in charge
thereof shall be known as the Building Official."

Section 103.3 "Deputies" is hereby amended and to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "For the maintenance
of existing buildings, see the International Existing Building Code."

(1) Section 104.6 "Right of entry" is hereby amended to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "If entry is refused or
no person having charge or control over the building or premises can be located, the Building
Official shall obtain a warrant from the City Court authorizing the Building Official to make entry
onto the building or premises."

(j) Section 104.8 "Liability" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The Building Official or his or her authorized representative charged with the enforcement of
this code, acting in good faith and without malice in the discharge of his or her duties, shall not
thereby render himself or herself personally liable for any damage that may accrue to persons or
property as a result of any act or omission in the discharge of his or her duties.

"This code shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating or controlling any building or structure for any damage to persons or property caused by
defects on or in such premises, nor shall the Code Enforcement Agency, any employee thereof or
City be held as assuming any such responsibility or liability by reason of the adoption of this code
or by the exercise of inspections authorized and carried out hereunder or by the issuance of any
permits or certificates issued pursuant to this Code."

(k) Section 105.3.2 "Time limitation of application" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"An application for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned six (6)
months after the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit
has been issued. The Building Official is authorized to grant on extension not exceeding six (6)
months. The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated."

() Section 105.5 "Expiration" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such
permit is commenced within twelve (12) months after its issuance, or if the work authorized on the
site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of one hundred eighty (180) days after
the time the work is commenced. The Building Official is not authorized to grant an extension."

(m) Section 106.3.3 "Phased approval" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The Building Official is authorized to issue a permit for the construction of the foundation of
a building only after the documents for the whole building or structure have been submitted and
approved by the appropriate referral agencies. The holder of a foundation permit shall proceed at
the holder's own risk without assurance that a permit for the entire structure will be granted."



(n) Section 108.1 "Payment of fees" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by Section 2.12.100 of this Code are paid
in full."

(o) Section 109.3.1 "Other inspections" is hereby amended to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "Other inspections
shall include but not be limited to line-grade verification and snow melt insulation and controls."

(p) Section 109.3.10 "Final inspection" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The final inspection shall be made after all work required by the Building Permit is
completed and all applicable referral agencies have accepted the work to comply with conditions of
approval and any specific regulations."”

(q) Add Section 109.7 Reinspections, to read as follows.

"A reinspection fee may be assessed when an inspection is called for and the work is not
complete, required corrections are not made, field copy of approved plans is not readily available to
the inspector, work is not accessible or for deviating from approved plans."

(r) Section 110.3 "Temporary Occupancy" is hereby deleted and replaced to read as follows:

"Section 110.3 Conditional occupancy. The Building Official is authorized to issue a
conditional certificate of occupancy before the completion of the entire work covered by the permit
or conditions of approval, provided that portions of the building shall be occupied safely. The
conditional certificate of occupancy shall clearly state the portions of the building that may be
occupied, the conditions that must be met and a time period during which the conditional certificate
of occupancy is valid."

(s) Section 112.1 "Board of Appeals, General" is hereby amended to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "The Building Code
Board of Appeals shall possess that authority as provided in this Code, Chapter 8.08."

(t) Section 406.4.2 "Ventilation" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"A mechanical ventilation system shall be provided in accordance with the International
Mechanical Code or an alternate design appropriate to cold climate conditions and meeting
acceptable CO levels may be proposed as an alternate design method.

"NOTE: Unless specifically addressed below, any sections designated by [F] may be amended
by the Fire Marshal in this Code, Chapter 11.04."

(u) Section [F] 903.2 "Where required" is hereby amended to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:]" ...in this Section and
in all structures 5,000 square feet or greater as defined by fire area (Section 702.1) and R
occupancy structures with four (4) or more dwelling units and two (2) or more stories high."

(v)  Section [F] 907.2.9 "Group R-2" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"A manual fire alarm system shall be installed in Group R-2 occupancies where:



"1.  Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located two (2) or more stories above the lowest
level of exit discharge:

"2.  [Remains as is]
"3, The building contains more than three (3) dwelling units or sleeping units."
(w) Delete Section 1203.2.1 and replace with:

"Attic ventilation openings, soffit vents and vents through roofs shall not exceed 144 square
inches each. Such vents shall be covered with noncombustible corrosion-resistant mesh with
openings not to exceed Y4 inch."

(x) Delete Section 1203.3.1 #6 and replace with:
"Noncombustible corrosion-resistant mesh with openings not to exceed ' inch."
(y) Table 1501.1, delete footnote (a) and replace with:

"Unless otherwise required to be Class A covering due to location in High Hazard Area as
indicated by the City of Aspen Wildfire Hazard Assessment Map."

(z) Add Section 1504.8 Snow shed design, to read as follows.

"Roofs shall be designed so that they do not shed ice and snow onto potentially occupied areas
such as a walkway, stairway, alley, deck, pedestrian and vehicular exit from buildings or areas
where there is potential for personal injury or property damage and areas directly above or in front
of gas utility or electric utility meters.

"Exception: Mechanical barriers installed to roof framing members or solid blocking secured
to framing in accordance to manufacturers' instructions."

(aa) Section 1505.1, delete the last sentence and replace with:

"The minimum roof coverings installed shall be Class B and Class A in the HIGH areas
identified by the City of Aspen Wildfire Hazard Assessment Map."

(bb) Table 1505.1, delete all C Classifications and replace with B Classification.
(cc) Section 1507.2.8.2 "Ice dam membrane" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"An ice dam barrier that consists of at least two (2) layers of underlayment cemented together
or of a self-adhering polymer modified bitumen sheet shall be used in lieu of normal underlayment
and shall extend from the roof eave edge at least six (6) feet inside the exterior wall line as
measured along the roof surface, twenty-four (24) inches from the centerline of the valley and up
twenty-four (24) inches on the vertical wall at a roof and wall juncture."

(dd) Section 1607.2 "Ground snow loads" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The ground snow load to be used in determining the snow loads for roofs shall be seventy-
five (75) pounds per square foot in the City."

(ee) Section 1612.3. Insert: "City of Aspen" for [NAME OF JURISDICTION].
(ff) Section 1612.3. Insert: "June 4, 1987" for [DATE OF ISSUANCE].



(gg) Section 1805.2.1 item #1 "Frost protection" is hereby amended to read as follows:
"Frost protection depth shall be thirty-six (36) inches."
(hh) Section 1807.4.3 "Drainage discharge" is hereby amended as follows:
Delete Exception
(i) Add Section 2111.1.1 Fireplaces allowed, to read as follows:
"The number of fireplaces allowed shall be determined by this Code, Section 13.08.070."
() Add Section 3001.5 Permits required to read as follows:

"Elevator permits and inspections are required through the Northwest Colorado Council of
Governments (NWCCOG)."

(kk) Section 3409.2. Insert: [DATE IN ONE LOCATION]

(Ord. No. 55-1999, §2 [part]; Ord. No. 47-2002, §12; Ord. No. 10-2003, §1, Ord. No. 59-2003, §1; Ord. No. 7,
2007, §1; Ord. No. 11-2009 §3)

Sec. 8.20.030. Violations and penalties.

(a) It shall be unlawful for any person, including an owner, occupant or builder, to erect, construct,
enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, quip, use, occupy or maintain any building
or structure in the City or cause the same to be done, contrary to or in violation of any of the provisions of this
Code.

(b) A violation of any of the provisions of the Code shall constitute a misdemeanor, punishable upon
conviction by a fine, imprisonment, or both a fine and improvement, as set forth in Section 1.04.080 of this
Code. A separate offense shall be deemed committed on each day or portion thereof that the violation of any
of the provisions of this Code occurs or continues unabated after the time limit set for abatement of the
violation. (Ord. No. 55-1999, §2 [part])

Sec. 8.20.040. Reserved.



Chapter 8.24
NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

Editor's note—Ord. No. 55-1999, §3, repealed former Ch. 8.24, pertaining to the Electrical Code and enacted a new Ch. 8.24 as herein set out. Former
Ch. 8.24 was derived from Code 1962 §§4-2-1—4-2-10, Code 1971 §§7-156—7-168 and Ord. Nos. 4-1962, 19-1968, 46-1968, 55-1974, 69-1974, 78-
1976, 2-1978, 3-1990, 21-1991, 42-1993, 53-1994, 4-1996 and 12-1996.

Sec. 8.24.010. Adoption of the National Electrical Code, most current edition and the International
Code Council Electrical Code Administration Provisions, most current edition.

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by the law of the State and the Charter of the City, it is
hereby adopted herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the National Electrical
Code, most current edition, published by the National Fire Protection Association, Batterymarch Park, Quincy,
Massachusetts, 02269 and the International Code Council Electrical Code Administration Provisions, most
current edition, published by the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills,
Ilinois, 60478-5795, except as otherwise provided by amendment or deletion as contained in Section 8.24.020
of this Chapter. At least one (1) copy of the National Electrical Code and the International Code Council
Electrical Code Administration Provisions, most current edition, adopted by the City, shall be kept on file in
the office of the City Clerk and shall be made available for inspection during regular business hours. (Code
1962, §4-2-1; Ord. No. 46-1968; Code 1971, §7-156; Ord. No. 55-1974, §1; Ord. No. 2-1978, §1; Ord. No. 21-
1991, §1; Ord. No. 42-1993, §1; Ord. No. 53-1994, §26; Ord. No. 4-1996, §1; Ord. No. 59-2003, §4)

Sec. 8.24.020. Amendments.
(a) Section 101.1 Insert: "City of Aspen" for NAME OF JURISDICTION].

(b) Section 301 DEPARTMENT OF ELECTRICAL INSPECTION is hereby amended to read as
follows:

"SECTION 301 ELECTRICAL INSPECTOR FOR THE DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

"Section 301.1 Creation of electrical inspector. The Electrical Inspector for the Division of
Building Safety is hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the Building
Official. The function of the Electrical Inspector is to assist the Building Official in the administration
and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

"Section 301.2 Appointment. The Building Official of the jurisdiction shall appoint the electrical
inspector."

(c) Section 401.3 "Work exempt from permit" is hereby amended by deleting item 5:

[Delete] "5. Electrical wiring, devices, appliances, apparatus or equipment operating at less than
25 volts and not capable of supplying more than 50 watts of energy."

(d) Section 404.2 "Schedule of permit fees" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by Section 2.12.100 of this Code are paid in
full."

(e) Chapter 11 is deleted in its entirety and shall read as follows:



"Section 1101. Appeals shall be in accordance with Section 8.08 of this Code.

"The following general amendments are made to the provisions of the National Electrical Code,
most current edition, herein adopted by reference:

"(a) All 125 volt, single phase, 15 and 20 ampere receptacles to serve counter top spaces
installed within six (6) feet of a sink, shall have ground-fault circuit interrupter protection for
personnel.

"(b) All storage areas and similar rooms in Residential Occupancies shall have surface
mounted lighting fixtures with a maximum lighting capability of 1 watt per square foot and 1
duplex outlet per one hundred (100) square feet of floor area or fraction thereof.

"(c) Article 210-52(d) Bathrooms. In dwelling units, at least one (1) wall receptacle outlet
shall be installed in bathrooms within thirty-six (36) inches (914 mm) of the outside edge of each
basin. The receptacle outlet shall be located on a wall that is adjacent to the basin and within
twelve (12) inches of the top of the basin. See Subsection 210-8(a)(1).

"(d) Receptacle outlets shall not be installed in a face up position in the work surfaces or
countertops in a bathroom basin location."

(Ord. No. 55-1999, § 3 [part]; Ord. No. 59-2003, § 4)

Chapter 8.28
INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE!

! Editor's note—Ord. No. 7-1971, adopted March 8, 1971, repealed former Art. VII, §§ 7-179—7-182, pertaining to the Gas Fitting Code. Said former

Art. VII has been reserved to maintain Code format and for future legislation.
Sec. 8.28.010. Adoption of the 2003 Edition of the International Fuel Gas Code.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the laws of the State and the Charter of the City, there
is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the
International Fuel Gas Code, 2003 Edition, as published by the International Code Council, 4051 West
Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, except as otherwise provided by amendment or
deletion as contained in Section 8.28.020 of this Chapter. At least one (1) copy of the International Fuel Gas
Code shall be available for inspection during regular business hours. (Ord. No. 55-1999 § 2 [part]; Ord No.
59-2003 § 5)

Sec. 8.28.020. Amendments

The International Fuel Gas Code, 2003 Edition, as adopted by the City of Aspen at Section 8.20.010 is
hereby amended to read as follows:

(a) Section 101.1(IFGC) Insert: "City of Aspen" for NAME OF JURISDICTION].

(b) SECTION 103(IFGC) DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTION is hereby amended to read as
follows:

"SECTION 103 DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

"Section 103.1 The Division of Building Safety is hereby created and the official in charge
thereof shall be known as the building official."



(¢c) Section 106.5.2 "Fee schedule" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by Section 2.12.100 of this Code are paid
in full."

(d) Section 106.5.3 "Fee refunds." Insert: "80%" for [SPECIFY PERCENTAGE].
(e) Section 109 (IFGC) Means of Appeal is deleted in its entirety and shall read as follows:
"Section 109.1 Appeals shall be in accordance with Section 8.08 of this Code."

(Ord. No. 59-2003 § 5)



Chapter 8.32
INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE

Editor's note—Ord. 5-1999, § 4, repealed former Ch. 8.32, pertaining to the Housing Code and enacted a new Ch. 8.32 as herein set out. Former Ch.
8.32 was derived from Code 1962 §§ 4-8-1, Code 1971 §§ 7-196—7-198 and Ord. Nos. 5-1965, 3-1971, 52-1974 and 12-1996.

Sec. 8.32.010. Adoption of the International Existing Building Code, 2003 Edition.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the laws of the State and the Charter of the City, there
is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the
International Existing Building Code, 2003 Edition, as published by the International Code Council, 4051
West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, except as otherwise provided by amendment
or deletion as contained in Section 8.32.020 of this Chapter. At least one (1) copy of the International Existing
Building Code shall be available for inspection during regular business hours. (Ord. No. 59-2003, § 6)

Sec. 8.32.020. Amendments.

The International Existing Building Code, 2003 Edition, as adopted by the City at Section 8.32.010, is
hereby amended to provide and read as follows:

(a) Section 101.1 Insert: "City of Aspen" for NAME OF JURISDICTION].

(b) SECTION 103 DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING SAFETY is hereby amended to read as
follows:

"SECTION 103 DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

"Section 103.1 The Division of Building Safety is hereby created and the official in charge
thereof shall be known as the Building Official."

(c) Section 104.6 "Right of Entry" is hereby amended to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "If entry is refused or
no person having charge or control over the building or premises can be located, the building
official shall obtain a warrant from the Municipal Court authorizing the Building Official to make
entry onto the building or premises."

(d) Section 104.8 "Liability" is hereby amended and to read as follows:

"The Building Official or his or her authorized representative charged with the enforcement of
this code, acting in good faith and without malice in the discharge of his or her duties, shall not
thereby render himself or herself personally liable for any damage that may accrue to persons or
property as a result of any act or omission in the discharge of his or her duties.

"This Code shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating or controlling any building or structure for any damage to persons or property caused by
defects on or in such premises, nor shall the code enforcement agency, any employee thereof or
City be held as assuming any such responsibility or liability by reason of the adoption of this code
or by the exercise of inspections authorized and carried out hereunder or by the issuance of any
permits or certificates issued pursuant to this code."

(e) Section 105.3.2 "Time limitation of application" is hereby amended and to read as follows:



"An application for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned six (6)
months after the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit
has been issued. The Building Official is authorized to grant on extension not exceeding six (6)
months. The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated."

(f) Section 105.5 "Expiration" is hereby amended and to read as follows:

"Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of this code shall expire
twelve (12) months after the date of issue."”

(g) Section 106.3.3 "Phased Approval" is hereby amended and to read as follows:

"The Building Official is authorized to issue a permit for the construction of the foundation of
a building only after the documents for the whole building or structure have been submitted and
approved by the appropriate referral agencies. The holder of a foundation permit shall proceed at
the holder's own risk without assurance that a permit for the entire structure will be granted."

(h) Section 110.3 "Temporary Occupancy" is hereby deleted and replaced to read as follows:

"Section 110.3 Conditional occupancy. The Building Official is authorized to issue a
conditional certificate of occupancy before the completion of the entire work covered by the permit
or conditions of approval, provided that portions of the building shall be occupied safely. The
conditional certificate of occupancy shall clearly state the portions of the building that may be
occupied, the conditions that must be met and a time period during which the conditional certificate
of occupancy is valid."

(1) Section 112.1 "Board of Appeals, General" is hereby amended and to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "The Building Code
Board of Appeals shall possess that authority as provided in this Code, Chapter 8.08."

(Ord. No. 59-2003, § 6)



Chapter 8.36
INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE

Editor's note—Ord. No. 55-1999, § 5, repealed former Ch. 8.36, pertaining to the Plumbing Code and enacted a new Ch. 8.36 as herein set out. Former
Ch. 8.36 was derived from Code 1962 §§ 4-3-1—4-3-5, Code 1971 §§ 7-213—7-218 and Ord. Nos. 1969-1, 9-1988, 58-1990, 53-1994, 53-1995, 12-
1996 and 43-1996.

Sec. 8.36.010. Adoption of the International Plumbing Code, 2003 Edition.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the laws of the State and the Charter of the City, there
is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the
International Plumbing Code, 2003 Edition, including Appendix C, E and F as published by the International
Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, except as otherwise
provided by amendment or deletion as contained in Section 8.36.020 of this Chapter. At least one (1) copy of
the International Plumbing Code shall be available for inspection during regular business hours. (Ord. No. 55-
1999, § 2 [part]; Ord. No. 59-2003, § 7)

Sec. 8.36.020. Amendments.

The International Plumbing Code, 2003 Edition, as adopted by the City at Section 8.36.010 above, is
hereby amended to provide and read as follows:

(a) Section 101.1 Insert: "City of Aspen" for [NAME OF JURISDICTION].

(b) SECTION 103 DEPARTMENT OF PLUMBING INSPECTION is hereby amended to read
as follows:

"SECTION 103 DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

"Section 103.1 The Division of Building Safety is hereby created and the official in charge
thereof shall be known as the building official."

(c) Section 104.8 "Liability" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The Building Official or his or her authorized representative charged with the enforcement of
this code, acting in good faith and without malice in the discharge of his or her duties, shall not
thereby render himself or herself personally liable for any damage that may accrue to persons or
property as a result of any act or omission in the discharge of his or her duties.

"This Code shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating or controlling any building or structure for any damage to persons or property caused by
defects on or in such premises, nor shall the code enforcement agency, any employee thereof or
City be held as assuming any such responsibility or liability by reason of the adoption of this code
or by the exercise of inspections authorized and carried out hereunder or by the issuance of any
permits or certificates issued pursuant to this code."

(d) Section 104.5 "Right of Entry" is hereby amended and to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "If entry is refused or
no person having charge or control over the building or premises can be located, the Building



Official shall obtain a warrant from the Municipal Court authorizing the Building Official to make
entry onto the building or premises."

(e) Section 106.5.3 "Expiration" is hereby amended and to read as follows:

"Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of this code shall expire
twelve (12) months after the date of issue."

(f)  Section 106.5.4 "Extension" is hereby amended to read as follows:
"No extensions will be granted."
(g) Section 106.6.2 "Fee schedule" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by Section 2.12.100 of this Code are paid
in full."

(h) Section 106.5.3 Fee refunds. Insert: "80%" for [SPECIFY PERCENTAGE].
(1)  Section 109 Means of Appeal is deleted in its entirety and shall read as follows:

"Section 109.1 Appeals shall be in accordance with Chapter 8.08 of this Code."
(G)  Section 305.6.1 Sewer Depth. Insert "48" for NUMBER].

(k) Table 702.3 Building Sewer Pipe is amended to delete "Vitrified clay pipe" as an allowed
material.

(I)  Section 904.1 Roof Extension. Insert "12" for NUMBER].
(Ord. No. 55-1999, § 5(part); Ord. No. 47-2002 § 13, 2002; Ord. No. 59-2003, § 7)



Chapter 8.40
WATER CONSERVATION AND PLUMBING ADVISORY CODE
Sec. 8.40.010. Applicability.

The provisions of this Chapter shall govern the construction and the landscaping of new residential,
commercial and industrial structures and the remodeling of existing residential, commercial and industrial
structures within the City. (Code 1971, § 7-231; Ord. No. 43-1981, § 1)

Sec. 8.40.020. Installation of high-efficiency fixtures.

No building permit shall be issued for the construction of a new residential, commercial or industrial
structure or for the indoor or outdoor remodeling of an existing commercial, residential or industrial structure
unless the design, construction or remodeling incorporates high-efficiency plumbing fixtures. In the instance
of indoor or outdoor remodeling, compliance with this Section shall be limited to that portion of the structure
for which a building permit is issued.

High-efficiency plumbing fixtures shall be defined as those fixtures which comply with the following
standards for water use:

(a) All water closets designed not to exceed a flow rate of one point 6 (1.6) gallons per flush.

(b) Urinals designed not to exceed one point zero (1.0) gallons per flush. The use of automatic
time flush devices for urinals shall not be permitted.

(¢) Shower heads designed not to exceed a flow rate of (two point five (2.5) gallons per minute.

(d) Lavatory, kitchen and service faucets designed not to exceed a flow rate of two point 2 (2.2)
gallons per minute.

(e) All commercial lavatories equipped with spring-loaded faucets that close when not in use or
faucets that are equipped with metering valves that close automatically after delivering a maximum of
twenty-five (25) gallons, except for required handicapped facilities which may be equipped with faucets
designed for the handicapped.

(f) Exceptions. Restaurant kitchen faucets and safety showers shall be exempted from the above
flow restrictions.

Other types of high-efficiency fixtures may be permitted provided that those fixtures are proven to use
no more water than those fixtures defined as high-efficiency fixtures. Such proof shall be made to the
satisfaction of the Building Department Official reviewing the application for a building permit. (Code 1971,
§ 7-232; Ord. No. 43-1981, § 1; Ord. No. 37-1991, § 1)

Sec. 8.40.030. Landscaping criteria; grass species, irrigation.

(a) To the extent practicable and consistent with the proposed design and use of the property,
landscaping shall utilize, for grassy areas, grasses which have the effect of minimizing the consumptive use of
water applied to such grass for irrigation. The Director of Parks shall promulgate an advisory list of drought
tolerant grass species and acceptable mixtures of such species. This list shall be updated as research and
experience dictate.



(b) For all outside irrigation, the development proposal shall include, to the extent practicable, an
irrigation system which would incorporate only equipment of the most water-conserving type commercially
available at the time the proposal is submitted for approval. Additionally, all irrigation shall be undertaken
with raw water if possible. At a minimum, irrigation systems shall:

(1) Be equipped with time-activated automatic control clocks and shutoff valves.

(2) Be equipped with sprinkler heads of a type which provide the most uniform coverage feasible
and maximum feasible droplets sized to reduce evaporation and wind disturbance of the coverage

(pulsating type).

(3) Where the slope gradient of the proposed development so requires, be designed to control flow
for the purpose of reducing runoff. (Code 1971, § 7-233; Ord. No. 43-1981, § 1; Ord. No. 37-1991, § 2)

Sec. 8.40.040. Raw water supplies (nonpotable).

Raw water supplies for irrigation systems shall be provided exclusively by the City Water Utility. The
owner of the property proposed to be irrigated from City water facilities shall dedicate to the City all raw water
transmission facilities and all water rights appurtenant to the proposed property. For those developments in
which raw water irrigation can be used, development proposals shall include provisions for recording of
covenants and restrictions against the use of treated water outdoors and against the use of untreated water other
than in accordance with the landscaping, irrigation and drainage management plan provided for in a
development proposal. (Code 1971, § 7-234; Ord. No. 43-1981, § 1)

Sec. 8.40.050. Soil preparation.

No building permit shall be granted for the construction of a new residential, commercial or industrial
structure unless the design of all landscaping areas primarily devoted to the cultivation of any species of grass
for aesthetic purposes and not for agricultural food production, includes proper soil preparation as hereinafter
defined.

Soil preparation shall be defined as the addition to existing soils of a minimum of three (3) cubic yards
per one thousand (1,000) square feet of organic matter introduced by tilling, discing or other suitable method
to a minimum depth of four (4) inches. Acceptable organic matter shall include compost, peat moss, aged
manures, aged sawdust or any combination of the above. (Code 1971, § 7-235; Ord. No. 37-1991, § 3)



Chapter 8.44
MECHANICAL CODE

Editor's note—Ord. No. 55-1999, § 6, repealed former Ch. 8.44, pertaining to the Mechanical Code and enacted a new Ch. 8.44 as herein set out.
Former Ch. 8.44 was derived from Code 1971 §§ 7-245—7-247 and Ord. Nos. 32-1981, 57-1990, 53-1994, 53-1995, 12-1996 and 43-1996.

Sec. 8.44.010. Adoption of the 2003 Edition of the International Mechanical Code.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the laws of the State and the Charter of the City, there
is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the
International Mechanical Code, 2003 Edition, as published by the International Code Council, 4051 West
Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, except as otherwise provided by amendment or
deletion as contained in Section 8.44.020 of this Chapter. At least one (1) copy of the International
Mechanical Code shall be available for inspection during regular business hours. (Ord. No. 55-1999, § 2
[part]; Ord. No. 59-2003, § 8)

Sec. 8.44.020. Amendments.

The International Mechanical Code, 2003 Edition, as adopted by the City at Section 8.44.010, is hereby
amended to provide and read as follows:

(a) Section 101.1 Insert: "City of Aspen" for NAME OF JURISDICTION].

(b) SECTION 103 DEPARTMENT OF MECHANICAL INSPECTION is hereby amended to
read as follows:

"SECTION 103 DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

"Section 103.1 General. The Division of Building Safety is hereby created and the official in
charge thereof shall be known as the building official."

(c) Section 103.4 "Liability" is hereby amended to read as follows:

"The Building Official or his or her authorized representative charged with the enforcement of
this code, acting in good faith and without malice in the discharge of his or her duties, shall not
thereby render himself or herself personally liable for any damage that may accrue to persons or
property as a result of any act or omission in the discharge of his or her duties.

"This Code shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating or controlling any building or structure for any damage to persons or property caused by
defects on or in such premises, nor shall the code enforcement agency, any employee thereof or
City be held as assuming any such responsibility or liability by reason of the adoption of this code
or by the exercise of inspections authorized and carried out hereunder or by the issuance of any
permits or certificates issued pursuant to this code."

(d) Section 104.5 "Right of entry" is hereby amended to read as follows:

[The Section shall remain as is except that the last sentence shall read:] "If entry is refused or
no person having charge or control over the building or premises can be located, the Building
Official shall obtain a warrant from the Municipal Court authorizing the Building Official to make
entry onto the building or premises."

(e) Section 106.4.3 "Expiration" is hereby amended to read as follows:



"Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of this Code shall expire
twelve (12) months after the date of issue."

(f) Section 106.4.4 "Extension" is hereby amended and to read as follows:
"No extensions will be granted."
(g) Section 106.5.2 "Fee schedule" is hereby amended and to read as follows:

"A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by Section 2.12.100 of this Code are paid
in full."

(h) Section 106.5.3 "Fee refunds." Insert: "80%" for [SPECIFY PERCENTAGE].
(1) Section 109 "Means of appeal" is deleted in its entirety and shall read as follows:
"Section 109.1 Appeals shall be in accordance with Chapter 8.08 of this Code."
(j) Add Section 901.5. Fireplaces allowed, to read as follows.
"The number of fireplaces allowed shall be determined by this Code, Section 13.08.070."
(k) Section 903.3 "Unvented gas log heaters" is amended to read as follows:
"Unvented gas log heaters are prohibited."”

(Ord. No. 55-1999, § 6 [part]; Ord. No. 47-2002, § 14; Ord. No. 59-2003, § 8)



Chapter 8.46

International Energy Conservation Code

Sec. 8.46.010. Adoption of the 2009 Edition of the International Energy Conservation Code.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the laws of the State and the Charter of the City, there is
hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the
International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the International Code Council except
as otherwise provided by amendment or deletion as contained in Section 8.46.020 of this Chapter. At least one
(1) copy of the International Energy Conservation Code shall be available for inspection during regular
business hours in the City Clerk’s Office, second floor of City Hall.

Sec. 8.46.020. Amendments.

The International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition, the addition of Appendix A “Residential
Renewable Energy Mitigation Program” and Appendix B “Commercial Renewable Energy Mitigation
Program” as adopted by the City at Section 8.46.010, is hereby amended to provide and read as follows:

Section 101.1 Insert: "City of Aspen" for NAME OF JURISDICTION].

(b) Section 107.2 “Schedule of permit fees” is hereby amended and to read as follows:

"A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by Section 2.12.100 of this Code are paid in
full.”
(c) Section 109 "Means of appeal" is deleted in its entirety and shall read as follows:

"Section 109.1 Appeals shall be in accordance with Chapter 8.08 of this Code."

(d) Add Section 110 “Liability” to read as follows:

"The Building Official or his or her authorized representative charged with the enforcement
of this code, acting in good faith and without malice in the discharge of his or her duties, shall not
thereby render himself or herself personally liable for any damage that may accrue to persons or
property as a result of any act or omission in the discharge of his or her duties.

"This Code shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating or controlling any building or structure for any damage to persons or property caused by
defects on or in such premises, nor shall the code enforcement agency, any employee thereof or
City be held as assuming any such responsibility or liability by reason of the adoption of this code
or by the exercise of inspections authorized and carried out hereunder or by the issuance of any
permits or certificates issued pursuant to this code."

(e) Section 301 “Climate zones” is deleted in its entirety and shall read as follows:

“The City of Aspen, Colorado and Pitkin County, Colorado shall use Climate Zone 7 in
determining the applicable requirements from Chapters 4 and 5.



€3} Section 402.4.2 “Air sealing and insulation” is hereby amended and to read as follows:

“Building envelope air tightness and insulation installation shall be demonstrated to comply
with the testing option section 402.4.2.1:

402.4.2.1. Testing option. Building envelope air tightness and insulation installation shall be

considered acceptable when tested air leakage is less than 0.35 air changes per hour (ACH)

when tested with a blower door at a pressure of 33.5 psf (50 Pa). The remainder of the section

remains unchanged.

402.4.2.2 is deleted in its entirety.

Add “Appendix A” to read as follows:
“Residential Renewable Energy Mitigation Program”

SECTION 101 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

Section 101.1 Scope. Residential snowmelt, outside pool, or outside spa systems and equipment may be
installed only if the supplemental energy meets the requirements of the Residential Renewable Energy
Mitigation Program (RREMP) Appendix A. This applies to all installations for which an application for
a permit or renewal of an existing permit is filed or is by law required to be filed with or without an
associated Building Permit that include systems described in section 101.1.

Section 101.2 Residential Renewable Energy Mitigation Program (RREMP) Option — Exterior energy
use for residential snowmelt systems, outdoor spas, and outdoor pools are calculated as directed by Section
201.

Section 101.3 On-site Renewable Credits Option — Renewable credit options are calculated as directed
by Section 301.

Section 102 Payment option. The RREMP payment option is the difference in energy use calculated in
section 202 and on-site renewable credits calculated in section 302 and shall be paid at the time of
issuance of the building permit. The payment, if any, is based on the amount of energy required, expressed
as dollars per square foot, to operate the exterior energy use systems. No payment shall be made to an
applicant that exceeds the energy use with on-site renewable credits. All monies collected pursuant to this
section shall be recorded in a separate fund by the City Finance Director and shall be spent in accordance
with a joint resolution by the Aspen City Council and Pitkin County Board of County Commissioners.
Section 103 Credits for on-site renewable energy. This RREMP payment option is voluntary.
Applicants interested in exterior energy use systems can alternatively choose to produce on-site renewable
energy (Section 301) with solar photovoltaics and/or solar hot water. Also the energy efficient technology
of ground source heat pumps is permitted for supplemental on-site energy. Micro-hydro and wind
generation systems will be credited according to industry standard site specific production reports.

Section 104 Pre-existing systems. Pre-existing snowmelt, pools or spas which are being overhauled

or renovated qualify for exterior energy credit. This credit can only be applied towards an installation

of exterior energy on the same parcel. The calculation of the credit shall be based on section 301.

Section 105 - Residential Repairs. Repairs to building components, systems, or equipment which do not
increase their pre-existing energy consumption need not comply with RREMP. All replacement
mechanical equipment shall be Energy Star© rated.

SECTION 201 EXTERIOR ENERGY USE CALCULATIONS
Section 201.1 Snow melt energy consumption shall be calculated as a RREMP payment option at $34.00
per square foot divided by the boiler efficiency (AFUE).

Section 201.2 Outdoor pool energy use shall be calculated as a RREMP payment option at $136.00 per
square foot divided by the boiler efficiency (AFUE).



Section 201.3 Spa energy use shall be calculated as a RREMP payment option at $176.00 per square foot
divided by the boiler efficiency (AFUE). Package spas not more than 64 square feet are exempt.

Section 202 The total RREMP payment option is the total sum of exterior energy use of sections 201.1,
201.2 and 201.3.

SECTION 301 ON-SITE RENEWABLE CREDITS

Section 301.1 Photovoltaic Systems — On-site renewable credit shall be calculated as $6,241.20 per 1
KiloWatt of the system design. Solar electric (photovoltaic) systems tied to the electric grid, are eligible
for on-site renewable credit. Systems must be sited, oriented and installed for solar electric panels to
supply at least 90% of rated capacity of the installed KW. System designer/installer must be certified by
COSEIA (Colorado Solar Energy Industries Association).

Section 301.2 Solar Hot Water - On-site renewable credit shall be calculated as $224.65 per 1 square foot
of the system design.

Section 301.3 Ground Source Heat Pump - On-site renewable credit shall be calculated as $6.84 per
100,000 BTU per year of the system design. In order to use a GSHP for on-site renewable credit the GSHP
system must supply at least 20% of the peak load for heating the house and all the exterior energy uses.
Section 302 The total RREMP on-site renewable credit is the total sum of sections 301.1, 301.2 and 301.3.

PUBLIC DOMAIN SOFTWARE
Section 401 A free calculation program known as RREMP 2009 shall be made available to the public.

EXAMPLE CALCULATION FOR RESIDENTIAL RENEWABLE ENERGY MITIGATION PROGRAM

Snowmelt Example
(Snowmelt requested 800 sq. ft.)
$34.00%800/ .91 (efficiency rating of boiler) = $29,890.11
RREMP payment option for exterior energy use will be $29,890.11
ON-SITE RENEWABLE CREDITS
96 square feet of solar hot water panels*$224.65 per square foot = $21,566.24
RREMP payment option will be $8,323.87
OR
4.8 KW photovoltaic system *$6,241.20 per kilowatt = $29,957.76

I RREMP payment oBtion will be $0 I

Add “Appendix B” to read as follows:
“Commercial Renewable Energy Mitigation Program”

SECTION 101 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

Section 101.1 Scope. Commercial snowmelt, outside pool, or outside spa systems and equipment may be
installed only if the supplemental energy meets the requirements of the Commercial Renewable Energy
Mitigation Program (CREMP) Appendix B. This applies to all installations for which an application for
a permit or renewal of an existing permit is filed or is by law required to be filed with or without an
associated Building Permit that include systems described in section 101.1.



Section 101.2 Commercial Renewable Energy Mitigation Program (CREMP) Option — Exterior
energy use for residential snowmelt systems, outdoor spas, and outdoor pools are calculated as directed by
Section 201.

Section 101.3 On-site Renewable Credits Option — Renewable credit options are calculated as directed
by Section 301.

Section 102 Payment option. The CREMP payment option is the difference in energy use calculated in
section 202 and on-site renewable credits calculated in section 302 and shall be paid at the time of
issuance of the building permit. The payment, if any, is based on the amount of energy required, expressed
as dollars per square foot, to operate the exterior energy use systems. No payment shall be made to an
applicant that exceeds the energy use with on-site renewable credits. All monies collected pursuant to this
section shall be recorded in a separate fund by the City Finance Director and shall be spent in accordance
with a joint resolution by the Aspen City Council and Pitkin County Board of County Commissioners.

Section 103 Credits for on-site renewable energy. This CREMP payment option is voluntary.
Applicants interested in exterior energy use systems can alternatively choose to produce on-site renewable
energy (Section 301) with solar photovoltaics and/or solar hot water. Also the energy efficient technology
of ground source heat pumps is permitted for supplemental on-site energy. Micro-hydro and wind
generation systems will be credited according to industry standard site specific production reports.

Section 104 Pre-existing systems. Pre-existing snowmelt, pools or spas which are being overhauled

or renovated qualify for exterior energy credit. This credit can only be applied towards an installation

of exterior energy on the same parcel. The calculation of the credit shall be based on section 301.

Section 105 - Commercial Repairs. Repairs to building components, systems, or equipment which do
not increase their pre-existing energy consumption need not comply with CREMP.

Section 201 EXTERIOR ENERGY USE CALCULATIONS

Section 201.1 Snow melt energy consumption shall be calculated as a CREMP payment option at $60.00
per square foot divided by the boiler efficiency (AFUE).

Section 201.2 Outdoor pool energy use shall be calculated as a CREMP payment option at $170.00 per
square foot divided by the boiler efficiency (AFUE).

Section 201.3 Spa energy use shall be calculated as a CREMP payment option at $176.00 per square foot
divided by the boiler efficiency (AFUE). Package spas not more than 64 square feet are exempt.

Section 202 The total CREMP payment option is the total sum of exterior energy use of sections 201.1,
201.2 and 201.3.

Section 301 ON-SITE RENEWABLE CREDITS

Section 301.1 Photovoltaic Systems — On-site renewable credit shall be calculated as $6,241.20 per 1
KiloWatt of the system design. Solar electric (photovoltaic) systems tied to the electric grid, are eligible
for on-site renewable credit. Systems must be sited, oriented and installed for solar electric panels to
supply at least 90% of rated capacity of the installed KW. System designer/installer must be certified by
COSEIA (Colorado Solar Energy Industries Association).

Section 301.2 Solar Hot Water - On-site renewable credit shall be calculated as $224.65 per 1 square foot
of the system design.

Section 301.3 Ground Source Heat Pump - On-site renewable credit shall be calculated as

$6.84 per 100,000 BTU per year of the system design. In order to use a GSHP for on-site renewable credit
the GSHP system must supply at least 20% of the peak load for heating the building and all the exterior
energy uses.



Section 302 The total CREMP on-site renewable credit is the total sum of sections 301.1, 301.2 and 301.3.
PUBLIC DOMAIN SOFTWARE
Section 401 A free calculation program known as CREMP 2009 shall be made available to the public.

EXAMPLE CALCULATION FOR COMMERCIAL RENEWABLE ENERGY MITIGATION PROGRAM

Snowmelt area 1200 sq. ft.
$60.00*1,200/.92 (efficiency rating of boiler) = $78,260.87
Pool area 700 sq. ft.
$170.00*700/.92(efficiency rating of boiler)= $119000.00
Spa area 80 sq. ft.
$176.00%80/.92(efficiency rating of boiler)=$15,304.35
RREMP payment option for exterior energy use will be $222,913.04
ON-SITE RENEWABLE CREDITS
448 square feet of solar hot water panels*$224.65 per square foot = $100,642.44
20 KW photovoltaic system *$6,241.20 per kilowatt = $124,824.00
RREMP payment option will be $0

(Ord. No. 11,2009, §1)



Chapter 8.48
ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS CODE

Sec. 8.48.010. Adoption of the 1997 Edition of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the laws of the State and the Charter of the City, there
is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the
Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, published by the International
Conference of Building Officials, 5390 South Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California 90601, except as
otherwise provided by amendment or deletion as contained in Section 8.48.020 of this Chapter. At least one
(1) copy of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings shall be available for inspection
during regular business hours. (Ord. No. 55-1999 § 7 [part])

Sec. 8.48.020. Amendments.

The Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, as adopted by the City at
Section 8.48.010, is hereby amended to provide as follows:

(a) Section 205 "Board of Appeals" is amended to read as follows:

"Appeals from determinations or decisions made by the Building Official relative to the
application and interpretation of this Code shall be processed and heard by the Board of Appeals in
accordance with the provisions contained in Chapter 8.08 of this Code. The Board of Appeals shall
possess that authority as specified in Chapter 8.08 of the Municipal Code."

(Ord. No. 55-1999, § 7 [part])
Chapter 8.50
FLOOD DAMAGE PREVENTION
Sec. 8.50.010. Findings of fact, purpose and methods of reducing flood loss.
(a) Findings of fact.

(1) The flood hazard areas of Pitkin County and incorporated areas are subject to periodic
inundation which results in loss of life and property, health and safety hazards, disruption of commerce
and governmental services, extraordinary public expenditures for flood protection and relief and
impairment of the tax base, all of which adversely affect the public health, safety and general welfare.

(2) These flood losses can be caused by increases in storm water runoff due to development and
the construction in or alteration of drainage channels. Uses that are inadequately floodproofed, elevated
or otherwise protected from flood damage also contribute to the flood loss.

(b) Statement of purpose. It is the purpose of this Chapter to promote the public health, safety and
general welfare and to minimize public and private losses due to flood conditions to specific areas by
provisions designed:

(1) To protect human life and health;



(2) To minimize expenditure of public money for costly flood control projects;

(3) To minimize the need for rescue and relief efforts associated with flooding and generally
undertaken at the expense of the general public;

(4) To minimize prolonged business interruptions;

(5) To minimize damage to public facilities and utilities such as water and gas mains, electric,
telephone and sewer lines, streets and bridges located in areas of special flood hazard;

(6) To help maintain a stable tax base by providing for the sound use and development of areas of
special flood hazard so as to minimize future flood blight areas;

(7) To ensure that potential buyers are notified that property is in an area of special flood hazard;
and

(8) To ensure that those who occupy the areas of special flood hazard assume responsibility for
their actions.

(c) Methods of reducing flood losses. In order to accomplish its purposes, this Chapter includes
methods and provisions for:

(1) Restricting or prohibiting uses which are dangerous to health, safety and property due to water
or erosion hazards or which result in damaging increases in erosion or in flood heights or velocities;

(2) Requiring that uses vulnerable to floods, including facilities that serve such uses, be protected
against flood damage at the time of initial construction;

(3) Controlling the alteration of natural floodplains, stream channels and natural protective
barriers, which help accommodate, detain or channel flood waters;

(4) Controlling filling, grading, dredging and other development which may increase flood
damage; and

(5) Preventing or regulating the construction of flood barriers which will unnaturally divert flood
waters or which may increase flood hazards in other areas. (Ord. No. 9-2002, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.50.020. Definitions.

Unless specifically defined below, words or phrases used in this Chapter shall be interpreted so as to
give them the meaning they have in common usage and to give this Chapter its most reasonable application.

(a) Appeal means a request for a review of the Community Development Engineer interpretation
of any provisions of this Chapter or a request for a variance.

(b) Area of special flood hazard means the land in the floodplain subject to a one percent (1%) or
greater chance of flooding in any given year.

(c) Base flood means the flood having a one percent (1%) chance of being equaled or exceeded in
any given year.

(d) Development means any man-made change to improved or unimproved real estate, including
but not limited to buildings or other structures, mining, dredging, filling, grading, paving, excavation or
drilling operations located within the area of special flood hazard.



(e) Existing manufactured home park or subdivision means a manufactured home park for which
the construction of facilities for servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes are to be affixed
(including, at a minimum, the installation of utilities, the construction of streets and either final site
grading or the pouring of concrete pads) are completed before the effective date of the ordinance
codified in this Chapter.

(f) Expansion to existing manufactured home park or subdivision means the preparation of
additional sites by the construction of facilities for servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes
are to be affixed (including the installation of utilities, the construction of streets and either final site
grading or the pouring of concrete pads).

(g) Flood or flooding means a general and temporary condition of partial or complete inundation
of normally dry land areas from:

(1) The overflow of inland or tidal waters and/or
(2) The unusual and rapid accumulation or runoff of surface waters from any source.

(h) Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) means the official map on which the Federal Emergency
Management Agency has delineated both the areas of special flood hazards and the risk premium zones.

(i) Flood Insurance Study means the official report provided by the Federal Emergency
Management Agency that includes flood profiles, the Flood Boundary-Floodway Map and the water
surface elevation of the base flood.

(j) Floodway means the channel of a river or other watercourse and the adjacent land areas that
must be reserved in order to discharge the base flood without cumulatively increasing the water surface
elevation more than one (1) foot.

(k) Lowest floor means the lowest floor of the lowest enclosed area (including basement). An
unfinished or flood resistant enclosure, usable solely for parking of vehicles, building access or storage,
in an area other than a basement area, is not considered a building's lowest floor, provided that such
enclosure is not built so as to render the structure in violation of the applicable nonelevation design
requirements of this Chapter.

() Manufactured home means a structure, transportable in one (1) or more sections, which is built
on a permanent chassis and is designed for use with or without a permanent foundation when attached to
the required utilities. The term manufactured home does not include a recreational vehicle.

(m) New construction means structures for which the "start of construction" commenced on or
after the effective date of the ordinance codified in this Chapter and includes any subsequent
improvements to such structures.

(n) New manufactured home park or subdivision means a manufactured home park or subdivision
for which the construction of facilities for servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes are to be
affixed (including at a minimum, the installation of utilities, the construction of streets and either final
site grading or the pouring of concrete pads) is completed on or after the effective date of these
floodplain management regulations.

(o) Recreational vehicle means a vehicle, which is (1) built on a single chassis; (2) four hundred
(400) square feet or less when measured at the largest horizontal projections; (3) designed to be self-
propelled or permanently towable by a light duty truck; and (4) designed primarily not for use as a
permanent dwelling but as temporary living quarters for recreational, camping, travel or seasonal use.



(p) Start of construction includes substantial improvement and means the date the building permit
was issued, provided the actual start of construction, repair, reconstruction, placement or other
improvement was within one hundred eighty (180) days of the permit date. The actual start means the
first placement of permanent construction of a structure on a site, such as the pouring of slab or footings,
the installation of piles, the construction of columns or any work beyond the stage of excavation or the
placement of a manufactured home on a foundation. Permanent construction does not include land
preparation, such as clearing, grading and filling; nor does it include the installation of streets and/or
walkways; nor does it include excavation for a basement, footings, piers or foundations or the erection
of temporary forms; nor does it include the installation on the property of accessory buildings, such as
garages or sheds not occupied as dwelling units or not part of the main structure. For a substantial
improvement, the actual start of construction means the first alteration of any wall, ceiling, floor or
other structural part of a building, whether or not that alteration affects the external dimensions of the
building.

(q) Structure means a walled and roofed building or manufactured home that is principally above
ground.

(r) Substantial damage means damage of any origin sustained by a structure whereby the cost of
restoring the structure to its before damaged condition would equal or exceed fifty percent (50%) of the
market value of the structure before the damage occurred.

(s) Substantial improvement means any reconstruction, rehabilitation, addition or other
improvement of a structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds fifty percent (50%) of the market value
of the structure before the start of construction of the improvement. This term includes structures which
have incurred substantial damage, regardless of the actual repair work performed. The term does not,
however, include either:

(1) Any project for improvement of a structure to correct existing violations of state or local
health, sanitary or safety code specifications which have been identified by the local code
enforcement official and which are the minimum necessary to assure safe living conditions; or

(2) Any alteration of a historic structure, provided that the alteration will not preclude the
structure's continued designation as a "historic structure."

(t) Variance means a grant of relief from the requirements of this Chapter which permits
construction in a manner that would otherwise be prohibited by this Chapter. (Ord. No. 9-2002 § 1

[part])

Sec. 8.50.030. General provisions.

(a) Lands to which this Chapter applies. This Chapter shall apply to all areas of special flood hazard
within the jurisdiction of the City.

(b) Basis for establishing the areas of special flood hazard. The areas of special flood hazard identified
by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in a scientific and engineering report entitled, "The Flood
Insurance Study for Pitkin County and Incorporated Areas," dated September 30, 1988, with an accompanying
Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM), is adopted by reference and declared to be a part of this Chapter. The
Flood Insurance Study and FIRM are on file at the offices of the Community Development Engineer and
(address of map repository).

(c) Compliance. No structure or land shall hereafter be constructed, located, extended, converted or
altered without full compliance with the terms of this Chapter and other applicable regulations.



(d) Abrogation and greater restrictions. This Chapter is not intended to repeal, abrogate or impair any
existing easements, covenants or deed restrictions. However, where this Chapter and another ordinance,
easement, covenant or deed restriction conflict or overlap, whichever imposes the more stringent restrictions
shall prevail.

(e) Interpretation. In the interpretation and application of this Chapter, all provisions shall be:

(1) Considered as minimum requirements;
(2) Liberally construed in favor of the governing body; and
(3) Deemed neither to limit nor repeal any other powers granted under state statutes.

(f) Warning and disclaimer of liability. The degree of flood protection required by this Chapter is
considered reasonable for regulatory purposes and is based on scientific and engineering considerations.
Larger floods can and will occur on rare occasions. Flood heights may be increased by man-made or natural
causes. This Chapter does not imply that land outside the areas of special flood hazard or uses permitted
within such areas will be free from flooding or flood damages. This Chapter shall not create liability on the
part of the City, any officer or employee thereof or the Federal Emergency Management Agency for any flood
damages that result from reliance on this Chapter or any administrative decision lawfully made thereunder.
(Ord. No. 9-2002, § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.50.040. Administration.

(a) Establishment of development permit.

(1) A development permit shall be obtained before construction or development begins within any
area of special flood hazard established in Subsection 8.50.030(b).

(2) Application for a development permit shall be made on forms furnished by the Community
Development Engineer and may include, but not be limited to:

(A) Plans in duplicate drawn to scale showing the nature, location, dimensions and elevations
of the area in question; existing or proposed structures, fill, storage of materials, drainage facilities;
and the location of the foregoing.

(B) Where base flood elevations are utilized, all new construction, substantial improvements
and other development must comply with requirements of Subsection 8.50.040(c)(2).

(b) Designation of the Community Development Engineer of the City. The Community Development
Engineer is hereby appointed to administer and implement this Chapter by granting or denying development
permit applications in accordance with its provisions.

(¢) Duties and responsibilities of the Community Development Engineer. Duties of the Community
Development Engineer shall include, but not be limited to:

(1) Permit review.

(A) Review all development permits to determine that the permit requirements of this Chapter
have been satisfied;

(B) Review all development permits to determine that all necessary permits have been
obtained from federal, state or local governmental agencies from which prior approval is required.



(C) Review all development permits to determine if the proposed development is located in
the floodway. If located in the floodway, assure that the encroachment provisions of this Section
are met.

(2) Use of other base flood data. When base flood elevation data has not been provided in
accordance with Subsection 8.50.030(b), the Community Development Engineer shall obtain, review
and reasonably utilize any base flood elevation and floodway data available from any federal, state or
other source. Where base flood elevation data are utilized, all new construction, substantial
improvements or other development in Zone A are administered in accordance with Subsections
8.50.040(c)(3) and 8.50.050(b).

(3) Information to be obtained and maintained.

(A) Obtain and record the actual elevation (in relation to mean sea level) of the lowest floor
(including basement) of all new or substantially improved structures and whether or not the
structure contains a basement.

(B) For all new or substantially improved floodproofed structures:

(i) Verify and record the actual elevation (in relation to mean sea level) to which the
structure has been floodproofed.

(i1) Maintain the floodproofing certifications required in Subsection 8.50.040(c)(1).
(C) Maintain for public inspection all records pertaining to the provisions of this Chapter.
(4) Alteration of watercourses.

(A) Notify adjacent communities, the Colorado Water Conservation Board and the Grand
Junction office of FEMA prior to any alteration or relocation of a watercourse and submit evidence
of such notification to the Federal Emergency Management Agency.

(B) Require that maintenance is provided within the altered or relocated portion of said
watercourse so that the flood-carrying capacity is not diminished.

(5) Interpretation of FIRM Boundaries. Make interpretations, where needed, as to the exact
location of the boundaries of the areas of special flood hazard (for example, where there appears to be a
conflict between a mapped boundary and actual field conditions). The person contesting the location of
the boundary shall be given a reasonable opportunity to appeal the interpretation as provided in
Subsection 8.50.040(d).

(d) Variance procedure.

(1) Appeal Board.

(A) The Building Code Board of Appeals, as established by the City, shall hear and decide
appeals and requests for variances from the requirements of this Chapter.

(B) The Building Code Board of Appeals shall hear and decide appeals when it is alleged
there is an error in any requirement, decision or determination made by the Community
Development Engineer in the enforcement or administration of this Chapter.

(C) Those aggrieved by the decision of the Building Code Board of Appeals or any taxpayer,
may appeal such decisions to the circuit court as provided in the State statute.



(D) In passing upon such applications, the Building Code Board of Appeals shall consider all
technical evaluations, all relevant factors, standards specified in other sections of this Chapter and:

(1) The danger that materials may be swept by floodwaters onto other lands to the injury
of others;

(i1) The danger to life and property due to flooding or erosion damage;

(ii1) The susceptibility of the proposed facility and its contents to flood damage and the
effect of such damage on the individual owners;

(iv) The importance of the services provided by the proposed facility to the community;
(v) The necessity to the facility of a waterfront location, where applicable;

(vi) The availability of alternative locations for the proposed use which are not subject to
flooding or erosion damage;

(vil) The compatibility of the proposed use with the existing and anticipated
development;

(viii) The relationship of the proposed use to the comprehensive plan and floodplain
management program for that area;

(ix) The safety of access to the property in times of flood for ordinary and emergency
vehicles;

(x) The expected heights, velocity, duration, rate of rise and sediment transport of the
floodwaters and the effects of wave action, if applicable, expected at the site; and

(xi) The costs of providing governmental services during and after flood conditions,
including maintenance and repair of public utilities and facilities such as sewer, gas, electrical
and water systems, streets and bridges.

(e) Upon consideration of the factors of Subparagraph 8.50.040(d)(1)(D) and the purposes of this
Chapter, the Building Code Board of Appeals may attach such conditions to the granting of variances as it
deems necessary to further the purposes of this Chapter.

(f) The Community Development Engineer shall maintain the records of all appeal actions, including
technical information and report any variances to the Federal Emergency Management Agency.

(1) Conditions for variances.

(A) Generally, variances may be issued for new construction and substantial improvements to
be erected on a lot of one-half (1) acre or less in size contiguous to and surrounded by lots with
existing structures constructed below the base flood level, providing items (i-xi) in Subparagraph
8.50.040(d)(1)(D) have been fully considered. As the lot size increases beyond the one-half ('2)
acre, the technical justifications required for issuing the variance increases.

(B) Variances may be issued for the reconstruction, rehabilitation or restoration of structures
listed on the National Register of Historic Places or the State Inventory of Historic Places without
regard to the procedures set forth in the remainder of this Section.



(C) Variances shall not be issued within any designated floodway if any increase in flood
levels during the base flood discharge would result.

(D) Variances shall only be issued upon a determination that the variance is the minimum
necessary, considering the flood hazard, to afford relief.

(E) Variances shall only be issued upon:
(1) A showing of good and sufficient cause;

(i1) A determination that failure to grant the variance would result in exceptional
hardship to the applicant; and

(iii)) A determination that the granting of a variance will not result in increased flood
heights, additional threats to public safety, extraordinary public expenses, create nuisances,
cause fraud on or victimization of the public as identified in Subparagraph 8.50.040(d)(1)(D)
or conflict with existing local laws or ordinances.

(g) Any applicant to whom a variance is granted shall be given written notice that the structure will be
permitted to be built with a lowest floor below the base flood elevation and that the cost of flood insurance will
be commensurate with the increased risk from the reduced lowest floor elevation. (Ord. No. 9-2002 § 1 [part])

Sec. 8.50.050. Provisions for flood hazard reduction.

(a) General standards. In all areas of special flood hazard, the following standards are required:

(1) Anchoring.

(A) All new construction and substantial improvements shall be anchored to prevent flotation,
collapse or lateral movement of the structure and capable of resisting the hydrostatic and
hydrodynamic loads.

(B) All manufactured homes must be elevated and anchored to resist flotation, collapse or
lateral movement and capable of resisting the hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads. Methods of
anchoring may include, but are not limited to use of over-the-top or frame ties to ground anchors.
This requirement is in addition to applicable State and local anchoring requirements for resisting
wind forces. Specific requirements may be:

(1) Over-the-top ties be provided at each of the four corners of the manufactured home,
with two additional ties per side at intermediate locations, with manufactured homes less than
fifty (50) feet long requiring one additional tie per side.

(i) Frame ties be provided at each corner of the home with five (5) additional ties per
side at intermediate points, with manufactured homes less than fifty (50) feet long requiring
four (4) additional ties per side;

(iii) All components of the anchoring system be capable of carrying a force of four
thousand eight hundred (4,800) pounds; and

(iv) Any additions to the manufactured home be similarly anchored.

(2) Construction materials and methods.



(A) All new construction and substantial improvements shall be constructed with materials
and utility equipment resistant to flood damage.

(B) All new construction and substantial improvements shall be constructed using methods
and practices that minimize flood damage.

(C) All new construction and substantial improvements shall be constructed with electrical,
heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities that are
designed and/or located so as to prevent water from entering or accumulating within the
components during conditions of flooding.

(3) Utilities.

(A) All new replacement water supply systems shall be designed to minimize or eliminate
infiltration of floodwaters into the system;

(B) New and replacement sanitary sewage systems shall be designed to minimize or eliminate
infiltration of flood waters into the systems and discharge from the systems into floodwaters; and

(C) On-site waste disposal systems shall be located to avoid impairment to them or
contamination from them during flooding.

(4) Subdivision proposals.
(A) All subdivision proposals shall be consistent with the need to minimize flood damage;

(B) All subdivision proposals shall have public utilities and facilities such as sewer, gas,
electrical and water systems located and constructed to minimize flood damage;

(C) All subdivision proposals shall have adequate drainage provided to reduce exposure to
flood damage; and

(D) Base flood elevation data shall be provided for subdivision proposals and other proposed
development which contain at least fifty (50) lots or five (5) acres (whichever is less).

(b) Specific standards. In all areas of special flood hazard where base flood elevation data has been
provided as set forth in Subsection 8.50.030(b) or Paragraph 8.50.040(c)(2), the following provisions are
required:

(1) Residential construction. New construction and substantial improvement of any residential
structure shall have the lowest floor (including basement) elevated to or above the base flood elevation.

(2) Nonresidential construction. New construction and substantial improvement of any
commercial, industrial or other nonresidential structure shall either have the lowest floor (including
basement) elevated to the level of the base flood elevation; or, together with attendant utility and
sanitary facilities, shall:

(A) Be floodproofed so that below the base flood elevation the structure is watertight with
walls substantially impermeable to the passage of water;

(B) Have structural components capable of resisting hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and
effects of buoyancy; and



(C) Be certified by a registered professional engineer or architect that the design and methods
of construction are in accordance with accepted standards of practice for meeting the provisions of
this paragraph. Such certifications shall be provided to the official as set forth in Subparagraph
8.50.040(c)(2).

(3) Openings in enclosures below the lowest floor. For all new construction and substantial
improvements, fully enclosed areas below the lowest floor that are subject to flooding shall be designed
to automatically equalize hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls by allowing for the entry and exit of
floodwaters. Designs for meeting this requirement must either be certified by a registered professional
engineer or architect or must meet or exceed the following minimum criteria:

(A) A minimum of two (2) openings having a total net area of not less than one (1) square
inch for every square foot of enclosed area subject to flooding shall be provided;

(B) The bottom of all openings shall be no higher than one (1) foot above grade;

(C) Openings may be equipped with screens, louvers or other coverings or devices provided
that they permit the automatic entry and exit of floodwaters.

(4) Below-grade residential crawlspace construction.  New construction and substantial
improvement of any below-grade crawlspace shall:

(A) Have the interior grade elevation, that is below base flood elevation, no lower than two
(2) feet below the lowest adjacent grade;

(B) Have the height of the below grade crawlspace measured from the interior grade of the
crawlspace to the top of the foundation wall, not exceed four feet at any point;

(C) Have an adequate drainage system that allows floodwaters to drain from the interior area
of the crawlspace following a flood;

(D) Meet the provisions of Paragraphs 8.50.050(a)(1), 8.50.050(a)(2) and 8.50.050(a)(3).
(5) Manufactured homes.

(A) Manufactured homes shall be anchored in accordance with Subparagraph
8.50.050(a)(1)(A).

(B) All manufactured homes or those to be substantially improved shall conform to the
following requirements:

(i) Require that manufactured homes that are placed or substantially improved on a site
(a) outside of a manufactured home park or subdivision(b) in a new manufactured home park
or subdivision(c) in an expansion to an existing manufactured home park or subdivision or (d)
in an existing manufactured home park or subdivision on which a manufactured home has
incurred "substantial damage" as a result of a flood, be elevated on a permanent foundation
such that the lowest floor of the manufactured home is elevated to or above the base flood
elevation and be securely anchored to an adequately anchored foundation system to resist
flotation, collapse and lateral movement.

(i1) Require that manufactured homes be placed or substantially improved on sites in
existing manufactured home parks or subdivisions that are not subject to the provisions in (a)
above be elevated so that either (a) the lowest floor of the manufactured home is at or above
the base flood elevation or (b) the manufactured home chassis is supported by reinforced piers



or other foundation elements that are no less than thirty-six (36) inches in height above grade
and be securely anchored to an adequately anchored foundation system to resist flotation,
collapse and lateral movement.

(6) Recreational vehicles. Recreation vehicles are prohibited per Section 16.04.080 of this Code.

(¢) Floodways. Located within areas of special flood hazard established in Subsection 8.50.030(b) are
areas designated as floodways. Since the floodway is an extremely hazardous area due to the velocity of
floodwaters which carry debris, potential projectiles and erosion potential, the following provisions apply:

(1) Prohibit encroachments, including fill, new construction, substantial improvements and other
development unless certification by a registered professional engineer or architect is provided
demonstrating that encroachments shall not result in any increase in flood levels during the occurrence
of the base flood discharge.

(2) If Paragraph 8.50.050(c)(1) is satisfied, all new construction and substantial improvements
shall comply with all applicable flood hazard reduction provisions of Section 8.50.050. (Ord. No. 9-
2002, §1 [part])
Chapter 8.52
BUILDING CONSERVATION CODE
Sec. 8.52.010. Adoption of the 1997 Edition of the Uniform Code for Building Conservation.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the laws of the State and the Charter of the City, there
is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the
Uniform Code for Building Conservation, 1997 Edition, published by the International Conference of Building
Officials, 5390 South Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California 90601, except as otherwise provided by
amendment or deletion as contained in Section 8.52.020 of this Chapter. At least one (1) copy of the Uniform
Code for Building Conservation shall be available for inspection during regular business hours. (Ord. No. 55-
1999 §8 [part])

Sec. 8.52.020. Amendments.

The Uniform Code for Building Conservation, 1997 Edition, as adopted by the City at Section 8.52.010,
is hereby amended to provide as follows:

Section 205 "Board of Appeals" is amended to read as follows:

"Appeals from determinations or decisions made by the building official relative to the application
and interpretation of this Code shall be processed and heard by the Board of Appeals in accordance with
the provisions contained in Chapter 8.08 of this Code. The Board of Appeals shall possess that
authority as specified in Chapter 8.08 of the Municipal Code." (Ord. No. 55-1999, §8 [part])

Chapter 8.54
EFFICIENT BUILDING CODE
Sec. 8.54.010. Efficient Building Code.

Deleted by Ordinance #11, 2009, §4; (Ord. No. 9-2003, §1)



Chapter 8.56
CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT PLAN
Sec. 8.56.010. Adoption of Construction Management Plan.

Pursuant to the powers and authority conferred by the Charter of the City, there is hereby adopted and
incorporated herein by reference as if fully set forth those regulations contained in the Construction
Management Plan Requirements Manual, as may be amended from time to time by the City Engineer. At least
one (1) copy of the aforementioned Manual shall be available for public inspection at the Community
Development Department and Engineering Department. (Ord. No. 23,2007, §1; Ord. No. 32, 2007, §1)

Sec. 8.56.020. Applicability.

The Construction Management Plan Requirements Manual, as adopted pursuant to Section 8.56.010,
shall apply to all construction and development activity within the City; provided, however, that the City
Engineer may waive one (1) or more specific provisions of the Construction Management Plan Requirements
Manual. Requests for waivers and any waivers granted by the City Engineers shall be in writing. (Ord. No.
23,2007, §1; Ord. No. 32, 2007, §1)



